
Longview City Council Agenda 
June 24, 2004 - 7:00 p.m. 

 
 
The City Hall is accessible for persons with disabilities.  Special equipment to assist the 
hearing impaired is also available.  Please let us know 48 hours in advance if you will need 
any special accommodations to attend the meeting. 
 
 
01. CALL TO ORDER Mayor Mark McCrady 
 
02. INVOCATION Retired Minister Bill Wells, First Baptist Church 
 
03. ROLL CALL  
 
04. APPROVAL OF MINUTES of June 10, 2004 

(LINK TO PAPERWORK) 
05. CHANGES TO THE AGENDA 
 
06. PRESENTATIONS & AWARDS  

A. PROCLAMATION:  RECREATION AND PARKS MONTH, JULY 
(LINK TO PAPERWORK) 

07. CONSTITUENTS COMMENTS 
 
08. PUBLIC HEARINGS  

 
09. BOARD & COMMISSION RECOMMENDATIONS  

 
10. ORDINANCES & RESOLUTIONS  

A. ORDINANCE NO. 2894, ADOPTING AND AMENDING BUILDING AND 
PLANNING CODES 
The Legislature of the State of Washington has enacted RCW Chapter 19.27 which adopted the 
International Building Code, the International Residential Code, the International Mechanical 
Code, and the Uniform Plumbing Code and Uniform Plumbing Code Standards with an 
implementation date of July 1, 2004.  The adopted codes will be applicable throughout the State 
of Washington, in all counties and cities, in substitution and replacement of all prior codes.  Local 
amendments have been kept to a minimum in an attempt to provide for a reasonable degree of 
inter-jurisdictional consistency.  The amendments that are proposed relate primarily to the 
administration of the codes.  The permit fees reflected in this code adoption are the same fees 
currently assessed with no increase proposed at this time. 
 
RECOMMENDED ACTION: 
Motion to adopt Ordinance No. 2894 adopting chapters 51-11, 51-13, 51-50, 51-51, 51-52, 51-56 
and 51-57 of the Washington Administrative Code as amended, declaring an emergency and 
providing that this ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after July 1, 2004. 
(LINK TO PAPERWORK) 



B. ORDINANCE NO. 2895, AMENDING LMC REGARDING READERBOARD SIGNS 
This Ordinance will permit the installation of changeable copy signs such as Parent Teacher 
Student Association informational signs at schools, motel advertisement of rates and specials, 
electronic market and membership information signs for banks, and similar such signs subject to 
the sign restrictions applicable to each zoning district.   
 
As Longview’s Comprehensive Plan update process progresses and zoning regulations are 
revised, it is staff’s recommendation that the sign provisions of each zoning district also be 
updated to include additional regulatory provisions as appropriate for readerboards, specifically 
tailored to each district. 
 
RECOMMENDED ACTION: 
Motion to adopt Ordinance No. 2895 amending Longview Municipal Code 16.13.040, Section 
1504(5) relating to readerboards. 
(LINK TO PAPERWORK) 

C. ORDINANCE NO. 2896, ADOPTING AND AMENDING INTERNATIONAL FIRE 
CODE 
The Legislature of the State of Washington has enacted RCW Chapter 19.27 which adopted the 
International Fire Code, with an implementation date of July 1, 2004.  The adopted code will be 
applicable throughout the State of Washington, in all counties and cities, in substitution and 
replacement of the Uniform Fire Code.  Local amendments are consistent with the International 
Fire Code and previous local amendments.  The local amendments that are proposed serve to 
clarify and standardize those sections of the Fire Code that are not specific or otherwise 
addressed.  The permit fees reflected in this code adoption are the same fees currently assessed 
with no increase proposed at this time. 
 
RECOMMENDED ACTION: 
Motion to adopt Ordinance No. 2896 adopting chapters 51-54 of the Washington Administrative 
Code as amended, declaring an emergency and providing that this ordinance shall be in full force 
and effect from and after July 1, 2004. 
(LINK TO PAPERWORK) 

D. ORDINANCE NO. 2897, AMENDING LMC REGARDING SIDEWALK BUSINESS 
LICENSES 
This Ordinance expands the area where Sidewalk Business Licenses are permitted to include the 
whole of the Downtown Commerce District D-C. 
 
The Downtown Advisory Committee supported this expansion/clarification at their April 23, 
2004 meeting.  
 
RECOMMENDED ACTION: 
Motion to adopt Ordinance No. 2897 amending Longview Municipal Code Section 12.30.090 
subsection (1) relating to Sidewalk Business Licenses 
(LINK TO PAPERWORK) 

E. RESOLUTION NO. 1794, 2005-2010 SIX-YEAR T.I.P. 
Following a public hearing on June 10, 2004 the City council directed the preparation of 
Resolution No. 1794, which adopts the 2005-2010 Six Year Transportation Improvement 
Program.  
 
RECOMMENDED ACTION: 
Motion to adopt Resolution No. 1794. 
(LINK TO PAPERWORK) 

11. MAYOR’S REPORT AND COUNCILMEMBERS’ REPORTS 

2 



 
12. CONSENT CALENDAR 

A. APPROVAL OF CLAIMS 
(LINK TO PAPERWORK) 

B. LIABILITY CLAIMS 
(LINK TO PAPERWORK) 

C. PLANNING COMMISSION MINUTES OF 6/2/04 
(LINK TO PAPERWORK) 

13. LIQUOR LICENSE APPLICATIONS  
A. RENEWALS 

The business establishments depicted on the exhibit are all currently licensed by the Washington 
State Liquor Control Board to sell and/or serve alcoholic beverages. Their respective licenses 
expire September 30, 2004. A check of local law enforcement records shows no liquor violations 
occurring at any of the establishments since their last renewal. The police department has no 
concerns with the licensees. 
 
RECOMMENDED ACTION: 
Motion as desired by council. 
 (LINK TO PAPERWORK) 

14. CITY MANAGER’S REPORT  
A. COLUMBIA THEATRE FOR THE PERFORMING ARTS ANNUAL REPORT 
 

15. MISCELLANEOUS INFORMATION ONLY 
A. BUSINESS LICENSES 

(LINK TO PAPERWORK) 
B. APPEAL BOARD OF ADJUSTMENT MINUTES OF 6/8/04 

(LINK TO PAPERWORK) 
C. PARKS AND RECREATION ADVISORY BOARD MINUTES OF: 

3/18/04 (LINK TO PAPERWORK) 
 
4/15/04 (LINK TO PAPERWORK) 
 
5/20/04 (LINK TO PAPERWORK) 
 

16. ADJOURNMENT 
 
 
NEXT COUNCIL MEETINGS: 
THURSDAY, JULY 8, 2004 AT 7:00 P.M. - REGULAR COUNCIL MEETING 
THURSDAY, JULY 22, 2004 AT 7:00 P.M. – REGULAR COUNCIL MEETING 
 
NEXT COUNCIL WORKSHOPS: 
THURSDAY, JULY 15 AT 7:00 P.M. – HEALTHCARE INDUSTRY, FOUR-YEAR 
COLLEGE PROGRAMS 

3 



Item 04        

 
 
 MINUTES OF THE REGULAR SESSION 
 OF THE LONGVIEW CITY COUNCIL 
 HELD THURSDAY, JUNE 10, 2004 
 
 
1.  CALL TO ORDER 
The meeting was called to order at 7:00 p.m. by Mayor McCrady. 
 
2.  INVOCATION/FLAG SALUTE
The invocation was pronounced by Ron Naff, First Christian Church.  Following the invocation, 
Councilwoman Leber led the flag salute.   
 
3.  ROLL CALL 
Present:   Mayor Mark McCrady 
    Councilman Kurt Anagnostou 

Councilman Ron DiRe-Day 
    Councilman Don Jensen 
    Councilwoman Ramona Leber 
    Councilwoman Susan Stockard 
    Councilman Dennis Weber 
    City Manager Ed Ivey 
    City Attorney Dave C. Spencer 
    Deputy City Clerk C. Maureen Abbott 
 
City Staff Present   
Don Barnd, Interim Police Chief; John Brickey, Assistant Director of Community Development; 
Jeff Cameron, Public Works Director; Bob Gregory, Assistant City Manager; Judy Jones, 
Information Technology Director; Kurt Sacha, Finance Director; and Lane Wintermute, Fire 
Chief.   
 
4.  APPROVAL OF PREVIOUS MINUTES
On a motion duly made and passed, the reading of the minutes of the regular Council 
meeting held May 27, 2004, copies of which had been submitted to the Mayor and members 
of the City Council, was waived and the minutes were approved as if read.   
 
5.  CHANGES/REVISIONS TO THE AGENDA - None 
 
6.  PRESENTATIONS & AWARDS - None 
 
7.  CONSTITUENTS' COMMENTS 
 
A.  Mr. Wagle’s Comments
L. S. Wagle, 1405 - 17th Avenue, pointed out that he is “personally not educated enough to say 
whether there is a god, the name of the god, the gender of the god, or the number of gods.”  He 
felt it was not the business of Council to say whether there is a god by inviting someone to 
present the invocation.  He thinks Council should follow the Constitution by not allowing a 
religious sermon at the Council meetings. 



City Council Minutes 
June 10, 2004 
Page 2 
 
 
B.  Longview Sign
Stan Juve, 4445 Rose Valley Road, expressed concern about the missing “to” on the “Welcome – 
Longview” sign at the town entrance on Tennant Way.  City Manager Ivey responded when the 
sign was purchased in conjunction with the Chamber of Commerce, it was assumed that people 
who read the sign would fill in the dots. 
 
Upon City Manager Ivey’s inquiry of additional welcome signs, Public Works Director Jeff 
Cameron noted that the City is currently working on securing the right-of-way at three potential 
entrances.  His department is currently working with the Washington State Department of 
Transportation (WSDOT) and Cowlitz County on several proposed sign designs. 
 
Mr. Juve suggested the City contact the Cowlitz Nation to get their input when determining an 
entrance sign as it “would make a difference in the healing that needs to take place here.” 
 
8.  PUBLIC HEARINGS  
 
A.  2005-2010 Year Transportation Improvement Project (T.I.P.) 
At the City Manager’s request, Public Works Director Jeff Cameron showed a brief PowerPoint 
presentation explaining the TIP process. 
 
Mr. Cameron noted that state law requires the City prepare and adopt a Six-Year Transportation 
Improvement Program (TIP) annually.  Local agency TIPs are consolidated by WSDOT into a 
Statewide Transportation Improvement Program (STIP).  Projects must be identified in the STIP 
in order to be available for federal or state funding.  Other funding agencies, such as the 
Transportation Improvement Board (TIP) and the Freight Mobility Strategic Investment Board 
(FMSIB), also require projects be included on the STIP.   
 
The TIP is a planning tool used to identify and prioritize transportation projects and their funding 
sources.  The TIP must include federal and state funded TIPs.  City staff also uses the TIP to 
show locally funded projects.  The TIP may be amended anytime by holding a public hearing. 
 
Mr. Cameron displayed a sample TIP document listing projects in priority order: description, 
classification, type of work, years that improvements will occur and estimated dollar amount of 
the improvements.   The TIP contains elements and projects which consist of pavement, curbs, 
sidewalks, traffic signals, illumination, pavement, markings, signs and transit. 
 
To fund projects in the TIP, the Federal Surface Transportation Program (Urban) (STP) provides 
approximately $350,000 annually, while a 13.5% local match is required.  With the current 
Federal TEA-21 Transportation Act expiring at the end of June, staff is unsure what the future 
federal funding allocation will be since Congress has not yet adopted a new Six-Year 
Transportation Act.   
 
The State also provides funding through the Motor Vehicle Fuel Tax Distribution.  Longview 
receives approximately $20,000 monthly toward the Arterial Street Fund which is intended 
primarily for capital improvements.  The Street Division budget receives approximately $42,000 



  City Council Minutes 
  June 10, 2004 
  Page 3 
 
monthly for street maintenance; additional funds are usually supplemented from the General 
Fund dependent upon Council’s discretion. 
 
Mr. Cameron also elaborated on some competitive programs including the Hazard Elimination 
Safety Program (HES).  Over the last five years staff has been highly successful in receiving 36 
grants from this program, which have been designated primarily for signal upgrades; however, 
staff has not been successful in obtaining Surface Transportation Program (STP) or State 
Transportation Improvement Board (TIB) competitive grants.  Generally Council appropriates 
about $600,000 of general fund resources into the Street Division Budget, and another $55,000 
for Sidewalk Repair Programs in the Capital Projects Fund.   
 
Mr. Cameron noted that the TIP will begin to address the deteriorating local side streets in 2005.   
The City’s annual transportation funding dilemma is whether the city should fund local roadway 
improvements using only Arterial Street Funds or leverage Arterial Street Funds as local match 
to obtain federal or state grants.   
 
The proposed 2005-2010 priorities include completing four remaining HES Grant 
Improvements: upgrading major corridor signals, implementing signal progression timing, begin 
pavement restoration, and resume the Columbia Heights Project in 2006.   
 
Funded project highlights of 2005 are signal upgrades which include progression timing 
implementation and installing emergency interrupt systems to Tennant Way, Ocean Beach 
Highway and Washington Way corridors. 
 
Funded project highlights of 2006 include the widening of State Route-432 and a potential center 
turn lane and a dual left-turn lane from SR-432 onto the Lewis and Clark Bridge.  Staff is 
optimistic that discretionary funding will be allocated by Congress. 
 
In 2006-2007 Columbia Heights Design/Right-of-Way and Fisher Lane Intersection 
improvements will be addressed.  Other projects include a signal upgrade project on 432 to 
install video detection after WSDOT paves 432 and destroys the existing detection loops. 
 
Concluding his presentation, Mr. Cameron remarked that during the period 2007 to 2010, 
upgrades to the Ocean Beach and 38th Avenue Intersection and 15th Avenue mast are planned. 
 
The Mayor opened the public hearing for comment at 7:30 p.m. There being no comments either 
written or oral, the Mayor declared the hearing closed. 
 
Councilman Jensen moved to accept the 2005-2010 Six-Year Transportation Improvement 
Program, and directed staff to present a resolution for adoption, which motion was 
seconded by Councilwoman Stockard.  Upon a vote duly held, the motion unanimously 
passed with seven "Aye" votes by Mayor McCrady and Councilmembers Anagnostou, 
DiRe-Day, Jensen, Leber, Stockard and Weber. 
 
9.  BOARD & COMMISSION RECOMMENDATIONS - None 
 
10.  ORDINANCES & RESOLUTIONS 



City Council Minutes 
June 10, 2004 
Page 4 
 
 
A.  Ordinance No. 2892, Amending LMC Relating to Parking at Lake Sacajawea during Go-4th 
Festivities
An Ordinance amending sections 11.45.030 and 11.45.040 of the Longview Municipal Code, 
relating to the parking of vehicles along 27th Avenue on the westerly side between Kentucky 
Street and Harding Street and along the westerly side of Kessler Boulevard for a distance of 
approximately 150 feet between Hudson Street and Hemlock Street, during the city-wide 
Independence Day celebration.  This ordinance permits recreational vehicles to be parked only in 
a parallel manner along 27th Avenue on the westerly side between Kentucky Street and Harding 
Street, and it permits “vendor” vehicles to be parked for a distance of approximately 150 feet 
along the westerly side of Kessler Boulevard between Hudson Street and Hemlock Street.  This 
Ordinance contains an emergency clause making it immediately effective.  The foregoing 
ordinance was introduced and read by title only. 
 
Councilman Weber moved adoption of the foregoing ordinance which motion was 
seconded by Councilman Anagnostou. 
 
Councilman Weber noted that this ordinance was requested by the Go-4th committee at the last 
Council meeting. 
 
Captain Barnd presented aerial photos displaying the both the current and proposed parking 
changes.  Due to past years’ challenges, Go 4th Executive Director Robbie Oldemar explained 
that additional RV parking was desperately needed.  The 150-foot variance in the handicapped 
parking was required to accommodate the pony ride vendor. 
 
On a vote duly held and recorded with 7 "Aye" votes by Mayor McCrady and 
Councilmembers Anagnostou, DiRe-Day, Jensen, Leber, Stockard, and Weber and no 
"Nay" votes, the Mayor declared the ordinance adopted and passed, affixed his signature 
of approval thereon and the ordinance was assigned the No. 2892. 
 
B.  Ordinance No. 2893, Amending LMC Relating to Animals at Lake Sacajawea During Go-4th 
Festivals
An Ordinance amending section 7.36 of the Longview Municipal Code by the enactment of a 
new section to be designated as section 7.36.115, prohibiting animals on the 4th day of July from 
being in Lake Sacajawea Park in the area bounded by Washington Way, Louisiana Street, 
Kessler Boulevard and Nichols Boulevard.  This ordinance contains an emergency clause 
making it immediately effective.  The foregoing ordinance was introduced and read by title only. 
 
Mayor McCrady announced that this ordinance was also at the request of the Go-4th Committee. 
 
Considering herself a responsible pet owner, Janet Mansfield of 3024 Hawthorne Street, 
acknowledged her support for the ordinance.   Due to the noise and crowd on July 4th, pets can 
become a nuisance and are much safer at home. 
 
Councilwoman Stockard moved adoption of the foregoing ordinance which motion was 
seconded by Councilman DiRe-Day. 
 



  City Council Minutes 
  June 10, 2004 
  Page 5 
 
City Attorney Spencer pointed out an error in the ordinance as he neglected to insert a provision 
to exclude hearing, seeing, and service dogs.  He assured Council he would add the appropriate 
wording. 
 
When the Mayor asked for a friendly amendment to include the language of hearing, 
seeing, and service dogs, Councilwoman Stockard amended the motion, and Councilman 
DiRe-Day seconded the motion.   
 
Councilman Anagnostou inquired about special arrangements for the vendors’ pets.  Ms. 
Oldemar confirmed that on Sunday, July 4th the animals will be contained in their RVs.  The 
owners have the option to walk them across the street, or to other available areas of the park.   
 
Ms. Oldemar confirmed for Councilman Anagnostou that the Go 4th Committee will advertise 
the fact that dogs and bicycles are prohibited at the Lake on July 4th.   
 
On a vote duly held and recorded with 7 "Aye" votes by Mayor McCrady and 
Councilmembers Anagnostou, DiRe-Day, Jensen, Leber, Stockard, and Weber and no 
"Nay" votes, the Mayor declared the ordinance adopted and passed, affixed his signature 
of approval thereon and the ordinance was assigned the No. 2893. 
 
11.  MAYOR'S REPORTS
 
A.  Councilman Weber’s Report
Councilman Weber attended a recent County Auditor’s Election Education Task Force meeting.  
He asked the Council to memorize a new slogan, “Get Four, Return One.”  In order for Cowlitz 
County voters to participate in the primary election, recipients must return one of four ballots 
(Democrat, Republican, and Libertarian) for their vote to count.  If the voter refuses partisan 
labels, they forfeit their right to vote; however, they can still vote for non-partisan located on the 
back of the ballot. 
   
12.  CONSENT CALENDAR 
There being no items the Council wished removed from the Consent Calendar, a motion 
was duly made and passed approving the items on the Consent Calendar as though acted 
on individually. 
 
A.  Accounts Payable
Based upon the authentication and certification of claims and demands against the city, prepared 
and signed by the City’s auditing officer, and in full reliance thereon, it was moved and seconded 
as shown in the minutes of this meeting that the following vouchers/warrants are approved for 
payment: 
 
First Half June, 2004 A/P Claims $594,974.25 (Check Nos. 248393 – 248403 and 248405 – 

248699, inclusive) 
Second Half May, 2004 Payroll $1,003,309.89, Check Nos. 187753 – 187889, inclusive; 

$330,359.45, direct deposits; and $308,594.86, wire transfers) 
 
Wire transfers made on 6/01/04 totaled $500,077.50. 



City Council Minutes 
June 10, 2004 
Page 6 
 
 
B.  Liability Claims 
The claim(s) for damages listed below was/were received by the City and have been/are being 
researched and/or reviewed by Washington Cities Insurance Authority (WCIA) and claim status 
is as noted: 
 
 1)  New:  Charles Melville, Property Damage - Unspecified 
 2)  New:  Shawn Kaber, Property Damage - $1,236.75 
 3)  New:  Dawn Register, Personal Injury - Unspecified 
 4)  Settled:  Daryl Erickson, Property Damage - $60.00 
 5)  Settled:  Ingeborg Gorden, Personal Injury - $52,246.98 (Trial Verdict) 
 
13.  LIQUOR LICENSE APPLICATIONS  
 
A.  Special Occasion Liquor License (Pioneer Lions Beer Garden) 
The special occasion liquor license application has been submitted to the State by the Longview 
Pioneer Lions for their annual beer garden scheduled for the 3rd of July.  The event is held in the 
grass field/parking area across 7th Avenue from the Fairgrounds/Exposition Center.  This year, as 
in years past, the police department will provide security for the event.  A total of six officers 
will police the event on paid overtime.  The City will be reimbursed by the Lions Club for these 
expenses.  The police department has not had problems with the event in the past. 
 
The Washington State Liquor Board granted an extension until June 14, 2004, for City 
approval/disapproval for this request. 
 
Mayor McCrady recognized that Council does not have the authority to approve applications; 
however, they can reserve the right to send a letter of opposition if there are concerns. 
 
Councilwoman Leber acknowledged that while the beer garden is held during a community 
festival, she referred to research that states when such events take place in a community (beer 
gardens specifically noted), they put our children at risk of using alcohol and possibly beginning 
a life of substance abuse. 
 
Councilwoman Leber moved to object to the Pioneer Lions Beer Garden request for a 
license, on the grounds that it creates a community “norm” favorable to alcohol use.  The 
motion died for lack of a second. 
 
Although he could not second the motion, Councilman DiRe-Day suggested he would like the 
organization to research other ways to raise funds other than the continuation of a beer garden. 
 
The Mayor suggested both Councilmembers send a letter expressing their concerns to the 
Pioneer Lions. 
 
Councilman Weber was reluctant to target non-profit organizations that generate money returned 
in the form of charity to the community. 
 



  City Council Minutes 
  June 10, 2004 
  Page 7 
 
Councilman DiRe-Day confirmed that his lack of a second was not intended to target non-profit 
organizations.      
 
Councilwoman Leber reminded Council several years ago they requested that this particular 
event move from the Civic Center to a place that was less visible, which at that time was the 
Fairgrounds.  She felt it was time for another “culture change.”  
 
The Mayor stated that he cannot support the banning of an event that is legal and no different 
than the activities taking place in our downtown establishments.  Councilwoman Leber 
challenged that a mere license application indicates that this event is different as it takes place 
out in the open.  She offered to provide a packet containing 40 years of research and longitudinal 
studies that show we put our children at risk with these types of events. 
 
Councilman Jensen remarked that in recent years while attending the event, he noticed that the 
event has changed and is more similar to a class reunion.  In addition, he has learned that the 
amount of revenue collected in the past has dropped.   
 
The Mayor concurred that with the increased emphasis on apprehending drunk drivers, more 
people are drinking responsibly. 
 
Councilman Anagnostou, who is a Pioneer Lion, verified that the funds raised for charity have 
declined over the last couple of years.  He also guaranteed that the annual event is strictly 
monitored by local police officers. 
 
No action was taken. 
 
14.  CITY MANAGER'S REPORTS 
 
A.  2005 Certified Local Government Grant Award/Contract with State for Historic Preservation 
Inventory of Old West Side, Phase Two 
The Community Development Department applied for and received a Historic Preservation 
Grant through the State Office of Archaeology and Historic Preservation.  The competitive grant 
is in the second phase to allow a small portion of the Old West Side homes to be researched and 
documented on State Historic Inventory Forms.  The grant award is $5,989 and would allow a 
consultant to provide volunteers to enter historical information and architectural features into an 
electronic state database.  Phase II is a continuation of the grant, and will be matched with a 40% 
in-kind contribution of staff time and volunteers.  The grant period is from October 1, 2004 
through September 30, 2005.  Due to its past success, additional grants may be applied for upon 
completion of this grant. 
 
Assuring that there were no issues of conflict of interest or an appearance of fairness, 
Councilman Weber supported the grant as his home currently receives special tax assessments 
for any renovations he performs that meet historical guidelines.   
 



City Council Minutes 
June 10, 2004 
Page 8 
 
Councilman Weber moved to approve acceptance of the grant award, and enter into a 
contract with the State, which motion was seconded by Councilwoman Stockard.  Upon a 
vote duly held, the motion unanimously passed with seven "Aye" votes by Mayor McCrady 
and Councilmembers Anagnostou, DiRe-Day, Jensen, Leber, Stockard and Weber. 
 
B.  Adoption of the 2004-2008 Consolidated Housing and Community Development Plan
Upon City Manager Ivey’s request to summarize the program, Assistant Planner Julie Hourcle’ 
acknowledged that her PowerPoint presentation illustrated the last step of a six-month process.  
In order to receive 2004 CDBG Entitlement funding ($443,000) and HOME Entitlement funding 
($405,124), the city is required to submit a Consolidated Plan for approval to HUD.  If the plan 
is approved by Council this evening, it will be ready for Mr. Ivey’s signature, and submitted to 
HUD by the June 15 deadline. 
 
Ms. Hourcle’ explained that the purpose of the HOME and CDBG programs is to develop viable 
urban communities by providing decent housing, a suitable living environment, and expanding 
economic opportunities.  The program, which primarily serves low- and moderate-income 
persons, covers housing and community development needs for the program and establishes 
priorities over the five-year period. 
 
The public process consisted of the solicitation for Home Project Proposals in December; agency 
and community meetings in March; public meetings from February to June; bi-lingual 
newspaper ads; Council workshops and hearings in April and May; a formal 30-day comment 
period in May; distribution of updates to agencies, media and interested persons; a KEDO radio 
show; and the final Council review this evening. 
 
Ms. Hourcle’ verified that public comments were reviewed and responses have been addressed 
and documented within the Consolidated Plan: 
 

• Columbia Legal Services wanted the plan to clearly identify and give high priority to 
the housing needs of extremely low-income households, recommended deep subsidy 
housing resources and set aside a significant percentage of its HOME funds to be used 
for Tenant Based Rental Assistance (TBRA) for the Kelso Housing Authority. 

• Home Care & Hospice supported a new Palliative Care Program (care for terminally ill 
cancer patients). 

• Lloyd T. Solon, referring to the Windemere subdivision, felt there was a lack of public 
information and was concerned that the CAP project would lower his property value.  
Ms. Hourcle’ commented that the plat was previously platted and approved for 
development, and it was the responsibility of the county auditor to determine property 
values. 

 
The Mayor asked if anyone had been contacted for this evening’s presentation.  Ms. Hourcle’ 
responded that no one was formally contacted as the evening was simply a presentation and not a 
public hearing.  She added that the comment period ended on May 30, 2004.  Councilman DiRe-
Day conveyed that he e-mailed the time-line of events to some of the interested parties.  
 

• ADC Pathways to Employment requested the Elk’s building be listed as an economic 
development project. 



  City Council Minutes 
  June 10, 2004 
  Page 9 
 

• Lower Columbia Community Action Council requested flexibility in housing programs 
by tenure and income, and wanted 15% of the CDBG to be set aside for public services. 

• Longview Downtowners requested funds be allocated for downtown street and alley 
lighting and safety patrols. 

 
Public Hearing Comments: 
 

• Habitat for Humanity wanted to change the HOME requirement from U.S. Citizen to 
Legal Alien. 

• Lower Columbia Community Action Council encouraged Council to keep public services 
funded at the maximum level (15%). 

• Longview Housing Authority wanted Council to consider the community’s homeless 
situation when finalizing the Consolidated Plan. 

• Bill Hallanger, Rental Property Management, emphasized that home ownership creates 
stability and permanency for families. 

 
Ms. Hourcle’ concluded by reiterating that the purpose of her presentation was to give Council 
the opportunity for final review and to consider any additional changes.    
 
Councilman Jensen moved to approve the final version of the HOME 2004-2008 
Consolidated Plan for submission to HUD, and direct the City Manager to sign the 
required certifications for submission and applications for funding, which motion was 
seconded by Councilman DiRe-Day. 
 
Councilman Weber inquired about changing the wording of the participation requirements, Ms. 
Hourcle’ clarified that both legal aliens and/or U.S. citizens are eligible for the program. 
 
Upon a vote duly held, the motion unanimously passed with seven "Aye" votes by Mayor 
McCrady and Councilmembers Anagnostou, DiRe-Day, Jensen, Leber, Stockard and 
Weber. 
 
C.  Driveway Variance: 1116 Ocean Beach Highway
City Manager Ivey stated that the Sherwin Williams Company has requested a variance to widen 
the existing driveway at 1116 Ocean Beach Highway, which would exceed the opening widths 
presently allowed, and serve large trucks, which have difficulty maneuvering through a standard-
width driveway.  The Community Development Department has also reviewed this request, and 
concurs with the recommendation for approval. 
 
Displaying aerial views of the proposed driveway, Public Works Director Cameron showed an 
approximate location of the new driveway apron.   
 
Rather than widening the driveway, Councilwoman Leber suggested creating an access road.  
Mr. Cameron explained that widening the driveway was the best option with the existing 
limitations.  Sherman Williams initially proposed that a semi tractor-trailer would use the inside 
lane to make a right turn into the parking lot, but staff requested a different way for their delivery 
trucks to enter from the correct right hand-land lane. 
 



City Council Minutes 
June 10, 2004 
Page 10 
 
Councilwoman Leber asked if it was possible to get the nearby Party Factory business to close 
their entrance located at the intersection and have all traffic use the widened driveway.  Mr. 
Cameron commented that staff did not consider that option because the intersection is signalized 
and there is already an existing left-turn pocket into the driveway and a signal head allowing 
protected access leaving the Party Factory. 
 
Councilman DiRe-Day moved to grant the driveway variance for Sherwin Williams 
Company as requested, which motion was seconded by Councilman Anagnostou.  Upon a 
vote duly held, the motion passed with six "Aye" votes by Mayor McCrady and 
Councilmembers Anagnostou, DiRe-Day, Jensen, Stockard and Weber and one “Nay” vote 
by Councilwoman Leber. 
 
Councilman Anagnostou announced that he would not be able to attend the July 15 workshop.   
 
Councilwoman Leber requested an excused absence from the July 8, 2004, City Council 
Meeting. 
  
15.  MISCELLANEOUS INFORMATION ONLY 
 
 1)  Meeting Reminders: 

Regular Council Meeting:  7:00 p.m., Thursday, June 24, 2004 
Regular Council Meeting:  7:00 p.m., Thursday, July 8, 2004 
Workshop:  7:00 p.m., Thursday, July 15, 2004, Training Room; Healthcare Industry, 

Four-Year College Programs 
 

16.  ADJOURNMENT
There being no further business to come before the Council at its regular session, the meeting 
was adjourned at 8:30 p.m. 
 
        THE CITY OF LONGVIEW 
 
 
 
             
       C. Maureen Abbott, Finance Dept. Aide 
 
 
 
APPROVED:       
         Mayor  



Item 06A 

Recreation & Parks Month - July 2004 
 

It’s July – the kickoff of the summer season.  It’s time to enjoy what your community 
offers.  Play your favorite sport, visit the outdoors, spend time with family and 
friends, or just kickback and relax.  That’s why the National Recreation and Park 
Association designated July as Recreation and Parks Month. 
 
 WHEREAS, the National Recreation and Park Association brings visibility to 
parks and recreation, including quality sports programs; and 
 
 WHEREAS, parks, recreation activities, and leisure experiences provide 
opportunities for young people to live, grow, and develop into contributing members 
of society; and 
 
 WHEREAS, recreation at park facilities creates lifelines that continue into life 
experiences for older members of our community; and 
 
 WHEREAS, parks facilities generate opportunities for people to come together 
and experience a sense of community through fun recreational pursuits; and 
 
 WHEREAS, park and recreation agencies provide outlets for physical activities, 
socializations and stress reducing experiences; and 
 
 WHEREAS, parks, playgrounds, ball fields, nature trails, open spaces, 
community and cultural centers, and historic sites make a community an attractive 
and desirable place to live, work, play and visit; and 
 
 WHEREAS, parks, greenways and open space provide welcome respite from our 
fast-paced, high-tech lifestyles while protecting and preserving our natural 
environment; and 
 
 WHEREAS, parks and recreation agencies touch the lives of individuals, 
families, groups and the entire community which has a positive impact upon the 
health, social, economic and environmental quality of our community;  
 
 NOW, THEREFORE, I, Mark McCrady, Mayor of the City of Longview, do 
hereby proclaim the month of July as 
 

“Recreation & Parks Month” 
 

in the City of Longview, and encourage all citizens to celebrate by participating in 
their choice of pleasurable activities to find refreshment in their leisure. 

In witness whereof, I have hereunto set my 
hand and caused the seal of the City of 
Longview to be affixed this 24th day of July 
2004. 
 
 
        

Mark McCrady, Mayor 



AGENDA SUMMARY SHEET
Business of the City Council 

City of Longview, Washington 
 

 
SUBJECT TITLE: 
Ordinance No. 2894 adopting and amending the 
International Building Code, the International 
Residential Code, the International Mechanical 
Code, and the Uniform Plumbing Code and 
Uniform Plumbing Code Standards. 
 
EXHIBITS: 
Ordinance No.2894 
 
 
COUNCIL GOAL ADDRESSED: 
 
 
 
PRESENTED BY: 
Edwin R. Ivey, City Manager 

 
Agenda Item: 10A 
 
Dept. of Origin: Community Development 
 
For Agenda of: June 24, 2004 
 
Clearances: 
Originator:  John Brickey, Ass’t Director CD 
 
City Atty Review Necessary? Yes 
 
Date/Initials of City Attorney: dcs 6/9/04 
 
Asst. City Manager:    
 

 

 
SUMMARY STATEMENT: 
The Legislature of the State of Washington has enacted RCW Chapter 19.27 which adopted the International 
Building Code, the International Residential Code, the International Mechanical Code, and the Uniform 
Plumbing Code and Uniform Plumbing Code Standards with an implementation date of July 1, 2004.  The 
adopted codes will be applicable throughout the State of Washington, in all counties and cities, in substitution 
and replacement of all prior codes.  Local amendments have been kept to a minimum in an attempt to provide 
for a reasonable degree of interjurisdictional consistency.  The amendments that are proposed relate primarily to 
the administration of the codes.  The permit fees reflected in this code adoption are the same fees currently 
assessed with no increase proposed at this time. 
 
 
RECOMMENDED ACTION: 
Motion to adopt Ordinance No. 2894 adopting chapters 51-11, 51-13, 51-50, 51-51, 51-52, 51-56 and 51-57 of 
the Washington Administrative Code as amended, declaring an emergency and providing that this ordinance 
shall be in full force and effect from and after July 1, 2004. 



 

 

 
Ordinance No.2894 

             
  

An Ordinance adopting chapters 51-11, 51-13, 51-50, 51-51, 51-52, 51-56 and 51-57 of 
the Washington Administrative Code, regulating and governing the conditions and maintenance 
of all property, buildings and structures; by providing the standards for supplied utilities and 
facilities and other physical things and conditions essential to ensure that structures are safe, 
sanitary and fit for occupation and use; and the condemnation of buildings and structures unfit 
for human occupancy and use and the demolition of such structures in the City of Longview; 
providing for the issuance of permits and collection fees therefore; creating a new chapter in the 
Longview Municipal Code to be designated as chapter 16.02; providing that Longview 
Municipal Code chapters 16.01, 16.03, 16.04, 16.05, 16.06, and 16.07 shall be applicable to 
permits issued prior to July 1, 2004, and amending chapters 16.01, 16.03, 16.04, 16.05. 16.06, 
and 16.07 by the addition of a new section to each of such chapters, and declaring an emergency 
and providing that this ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after July 1, 2004. 
 
             
 
 WHEREAS, the Legislature of the State of Washington has enacted RCW chapter 19.27 
which adopted the International Building Code, the International Residential Code, the 
International Mechanical Code, and the Uniform Plumbing Code and Uniform Plumbing Code 
Standards, and provided that such codes shall be applicable throughout the State of Washington, 
in all counties and cities, in substitution and replacement of all prior codes; and 
 
 WHEREAS, the Washington State Building Codes Council has adopted, in the 
Washington State Administrative Code, chapters 51-11 (Energy Code), 51-13 (Ventilation and 
Indoor Air Quality Code), 51-50 (International Building Code), 51-51 (International Residential 
Code), 51-52 (International Mechanical Code), and 51-56 and 51-57) Uniform Plumbing Code 
and Uniform Plumbing Code Standards; and 
 
 WHEREAS, by reason of such enactment, it is necessary that the City of Longview adopt 
such codes; and 
 
 WHEREAS, permits issued prior to the effective date of this Ordinance, or for which 
complete applications were submitted prior to such effective date, should be governed by the 
provisions of the then existing codes, and the provisions of the International Building Code, the 
International Residential Code, the International Mechanical Code and the Uniform Plumbing 
Code should be applicable only to permits for which application is made after the effective date 
of this Ordinance and/or for construction activities not conducted pursuant to permits for which 
application was made prior to the effective date of this Ordinance; and 
 
 WHEREAS, the effective date of the application of such International Codes has been set 
at July 1, 2004 by the Washington State Legislature, and in order to provide for such an effective 
date of this Ordinance, it is necessary that the City Council declare an emergency in order to 
provide that this Ordinance shall become effective and in full force and effect on and after July 
1, 2004; 
 



 

 

 NOW, THEREFORE, the City Council of the City of Longview, Washington, do ordain 
as follows: 
 
SECTION 1. That Title 16 of the Longview Municipal Code shall be and is hereby amended by 
the addition of a new chapter thereto, to be designated as Chapter 16.02, reading as follows: 
 
 16.02.010 Adoption of International Building Codes. 

That Washington State Administrative Code Chapters 51-11 (Energy Code), 51-13 
(Ventilation and Indoor Air Quality Code) 51-50 (International Building Code) including 
the Appendix Chapters E as further amended by WAC 51-50, I and J , 51-51 
(International Residential Code) including the Appendix Chapters G and H, 51-52 
(International Mechanical Code), and 51-56 and 51-57 (Uniform Plumbing Code and 
Uniform Plumbing Code Standards), together with amendments thereof and additions 
thereto, one (1) copy of each of which is on file in the office of the City Clerk of the City 
of Longview, shall be and is hereby adopted as the Building Code of the City of 
Longview for regulating and governing the conditions and maintenance of all property, 
buildings and structures; by providing the standards for supplied utilities and facilities 
and other physical things and conditions essential to ensure that structures are safe, 
sanitary and fit for occupation and use; and the condemnation of buildings and structures 
unfit for human occupancy and use and the demolition of such structures as herein 
provided; providing for the issuance of permits and collection of fees therefore; and each 
and all of the regulations, provisions, penalties, conditions and terms of said Building 
Code on file in the office of the City Clerk of the City of Longview are hereby referred 
to, adopted, and made a part hereof, as if fully set out in this Ordinance, with the 
additions, insertions, deletions and changes, if any, prescribed in this chapter. 

 
 16.02.020 Administrative provisions: 
 For the purpose of providing administrative provisions for the Building Code of 
 Longview, including WAC chapters 51-11, 51-13, 51-50, 51-51, 51-52, 51-56 and 51-
 57,Subchapter 1 of WAC chapter 51-50 is hereby amended to read as follows:  
 

Section 101.1  These regulations shall be known as the Building Code of the City of 
Longview, Washington, sometimes hereinafter referred to in this chapter as “this code.” 
 
Section 101.4.1  Electrical, is amended to read as follows: 
 
The provisions of the National Electrical Code as adopted in Longview Municipal Code 
Chapter 16.23 shall apply to the installation of electrical systems, including alterations, 
repairs, replacement, equipment, appliances, fixtures, fittings and appurtenances thereto. 

 
Section 101.4.4 Plumbing, is amended to read as follows: 
 
The provisions of the Uniform Plumbing Code as amended by WAC 51-56 and 51-57 as 
adopted herein shall apply to the installation, alteration, repair and replacement of 
plumbing systems, including equipment, appliances, fixtures, fittings and appurtenances, 
and where connected to a water or sewage system and all aspects of a medical gas 



 

system.  The provisions of the State of Washington requirements for private sewage 
disposal shall apply to private sewage disposal systems. 
 
Section 101.4.5 Property Maintenance, is amended to read as follows: 
 
The provisions of Longview Municipal Code Chapter 16.32 (Unfit Dwellings and 
Structures) shall apply to all structures and premises; all equipment and facilities; all 
light, ventilation, space heating, sanitation, life and fire safety hazards; the 
responsibilities of owners, operators and occupants; and the occupancy of existing 
premises and structures. 
 
Section 101.4.7  Energy, is amended to read as follows: 
 
The provisions of the State of Washington Energy Code as set forth in WAC 51-11 shall 
apply to all matters governing the design and construction of buildings for energy 
efficiency. 
 
Section 101.4.8 Ventilation and Indoor Air Quality, is amended to read as follows: 
 
The provisions of the State of Washington Ventilation and Indoor Air Quality Code as set 
forth in WAC 51-13 shall apply to all matters governing the design and construction of 
buildings for ventilation and indoor air quality. 
 
Section 102.6 Existing Structures, is amended to read: 
 
The legal occupancy of any structure existing on the date of adoption of this code shall be 
permitted to continue without change, except as is specifically covered in this code, or 
the International Fire Code as set forth in LMC Title 18, or as is deemed necessary by 
the building official for the general safety and welfare of the occupants and the public. 
 
Section 103.3  Deputies is amended to read: 
 
In accordance with the prescribed procedures of the City of Longview and with the 
concurrence of the appointing authority, the building official shall have the authority to 
appoint a deputy building official, the related technical officers, inspectors, plan 
examiners and other employees.  Such employees shall have powers as delegated by the 
building official.  
  
Section 104.1 General, is amended to read: 
 
The building official is hereby authorized and directed to enforce the provisions of this 
code, including any requirements or regulations imposed on a project as a condition of a 
land use approval process, as those conditions relate to permit issuance as required in 
Section 105.3.1 and issuance of a certificate of occupancy as required in Section 110.2.1.  
The building official shall have the authority to render interpretations of this code and to 
adopt policies and procedures in order to clarify the application of its provisions.  Such 

 



 

interpretations, policies and procedures shall be in compliance with the intent and 
purpose of this code.  Such policies and procedures shall not have the effect of waiving 
requirements specifically provided for in this code. 
 
Section 105.2  Work exempt from permit, is amended as follows: 
 
Subsections 1, 2, 4, 6 and 12 of section 105.2 are deleted. 
 
Subsection 11 of section 105.2 is amended to read as follows: 
 
 Swings and other playground equipment. 
 
Section 107.3 Temporary Power, is amended to read: 
 
The building official is authorized to give permission to temporarily supply and use 
power in part of an electric installation before such installation has been fully completed 
and the final certificate of completion has been issued.  The part covered by the 
temporary certificate shall comply with the requirements specified for temporary lighting, 
heat or power in the National Electrical Code as set forth in Longview Municipal Code 
Chapter 16.23. 
 
Section 108.2 Schedule Permit fees, is amended as follows: 
 
On buildings, structures, electrical, gas, mechanical, and plumbing systems or alterations 
requiring a permit, a fee for each permit shall be charged and paid in accordance with the 
established fee schedules as set forth in Section 108.2.1, 108.2.1.1, 108.2.1.2, 108.2.1.3, 
108.2.2, and 108.2.3. 
 
Section 108.2.1 is hereby added, reading as follows: 
 
Section 108.2.1 Building Permit Fee 
 
The fee for each building permit shall be as set forth in Table 1-A herein.   
 

Table 1-A – Building Permit Fees 
 

TOTAL VALUATION FEE 
$1.00 to $500.00 $25.25 
$501.00 TO $2,000.00 $25.25 for the first $500.00 plus $3.30 for each additional $100.00, or 

fraction thereof, to and including $2,000.00 
$2,001.00 to $25,000.00 $81.15 for the first $2,000.00 plus $14.95 for each additional $1,000.00, or 

fraction thereof, to and including $25,000.00 
$25,001.00 to $50,000.00 $417.75 for the first $25,000.00 plus $10.80 for each additional $1,000.00, 

or fraction thereof, to and including $50,000.00 
$50,001.00 to $100,000.00 $687.50 for the first $50,000.00 plus $7.50 for each additional $1,000.00, or 

fraction thereof, to and including $100,000.00 
$100,001.00 to $500,000.00 $1,061.25 for the first $100,000.00 plus $6.00 for each additional $1,000.00, 

or fraction thereof, to and including $500,000.00 
$500,001.00 to $1,000,000.00 $3,453.25 for the first $500,000.00 plus $5.10 for each additional $1,000.00, 

 



 

or fraction thereof, to and including $1,000,000.00 
$1,000,001.00 and up $5,989.40 for the first $1,000,000.00 plus $4.00 for each additional 

$1,000.00, or fraction thereof 

 
Other Inspections and Fees: 
1. Inspections outside of normal business hours ………………………………………………$51.00 per hour1 

(minimum charge – two hours) 
2. Reinspection fees assessed under provisions of Section 305.8 …………………………..$51.00 per hour1 
3. Inspections for which no fee is specifically indicated ……………………………………….$51.00 per hour1 

(minimum charge – one-half hour) 
4. Additional plan review required by changes, additions or revisions to plans …………….$51.00 per hour1 

(minimum charge – one-half hour) 
5.    For use of outside consultants for plan checking and inspections, or both …………………  Actual Costs2

1  Or the total hourly cost to the jurisdiction, whichever is the greatest.  This cost shall include supervision, overhead,  

   equipment, hourly wages and fringe benefits of the employees involved. 

2  Actual costs include administrative and overhead costs.
 

Section 108.2.1.1 is hereby added, reading as follows: 
 
Section 108.2.1.1 Inspection Fee – Manufactured Housing  
 
The fees for inspections of manufactured housing situated in a  
mobile home park shall be as follows: 
 

(a) Single-wide $106.75 
(b) Double-wide $133.50 
(c) Triple-wide $160.20 

 
 Section 108.2.1.2 is hereby added, reading as follows: 

 
Section 108.2.1.2 Inspection Fee – Wood Stoves  

 
The fees for inspection of free-standing wood stoves shall be  
the sum of $21.50 
 

 Section 108.2.1.3 Plan Review Fees, is added as follows: 
 

When submittal documents are required by Section 106, a plan 
review fee shall be paid at the time of submitting the submittal 
documents for plan review.  Said plan review fee for reviews 
relating to the provisions of the International Residential Code for 
One- and Two-Family Dwellings shall be 65 percent of the 
building permit fee and said plan review fee for all other reviews 
shall be 70 percent of the building permit fee as shown in Table 1-

                                                 
 
 

 
 
 

 



 

A. The plan review fees specified in this section are separate fees 
from the permit fees specified in Section 108.6 and are in addition 
to the permit fees. 
 
When submittal documents are incomplete or changed so as to 
require additional plan review or when the project involves 
deferred submittal items as defined in Section 106.3.4.2, an 
additional plan review fee shall be charged at the rate shown in 
Table 1-A. 
 
Section 108.2.2 is hereby added, reading as follows: 
 
Section 108.2.2 Mechanical Permit Fee 
 
The fee for each Mechanical permit shall be as set forth Table 2-A herein.   
 

Table 2-A  Mechanical Permit Fees 
 

Permit Issuance 
1. For the issuance of each mechanical permit ……………………………………………….. $21.40 
2. For issuing each supplemental permit for which the original permit has not expired,  

been canceled or finaled ………………………………………………………….………... $10.70 
 

Unit Fee Schedule 
 (Note: The following do not include permit-issuing fee.) 
1. Furnaces 

For the installation or relocation of each forced-air or gravity-type furnace or burner,  
including ducts and vents attached to such appliance up to and including 100,000 Btu/h 
(29.3 kW) …………............................................................................................................…$15.80 
For the installation or relocation of each forced-air or gravity-type furnace or burner, 
including ducts and vents attached to such appliance over 100,000 Btu/h (29.3 kW) ..….…$19.60 
For the installation or relocation of each floor furnace, including vent ..………………...…$15.80 
For the installation or relocation of each suspended heater, recessed wall heater or floor- 
mounted unit heater …………………………………………………………...………..…... $15.80 

2. Appliance Vents 
For the installation, relocation or replacement of each appliance vent installed and not  
included in an appliance permit .………………………………………………………….…. $7.65 

3. Repairs or Additions 
For the repair of, alteration of, or addition to each heating appliance, refrigeration unit, cooling 
unit, absorption unit, or each heating, cooling, absorption or evaporative cooling system, 
including installation of controls regulated by the Mechanical Code ….………………….. $14.75 

4. Boilers, Compressors and Absorption Systems 
For the installation or relocation of each boiler or compressor to and including 3 horsepower 
(10.6 kW), or each absorption system to and including 100,000 Btu/h (29.3 kW) ……….. $15.80 
For the installation or relocation of each boiler or compressor over three horsepower (10.6 kW)  
to and including 15 horsepower (52.7 kW), or each absorption system over 100,000 Btu/h  
(29.3 kW) to and including 500,000 Btu/h (146.6 kW) ……………………………………… $29.00 
For the installation or relocation of each boiler or compressor over 15 horsepower (52.7 kW)  
to and including 30 horsepower (105.5 kW), or each absorption system over 500,000 Btu/h  
(146.6 kW) to and including 1,000,000 Btu/h (293.1 kW) .…….……………...………….… $39.95 
For the installation or relocation of each boiler or compressor over 30 horsepower (105.5 kW)  
to and including 50 horsepower (176 kW), or each absorption system over 1,000,000 Btu/h  
(293.1 kW) to and including 1,750,000 Btu/h (512.9 kW) .………………………………… $59.25 
For the installation or relocation of each boiler or compressor over 50 horsepower (176 kW),  
or  each absorption system over 1,750,000 Btu/h (512.9 kW) ……………………….…..…. $98.95 
 

5. Air Handlers 

 



 

For each air-handling unit to and including 10,000 cubic feet per minute (cfm) (4719 L/s),  
including ducts attached thereto ……………………………………………………….…….$11.45 
Note: This fee does not apply to an air-handling unit which is a portion of a factory-assembled appliance, cooling unit, evaporative cooler, 
or absorption unit for which a permit is required elsewhere in the Mechanical Code. 
For each air-handling unit over 10,000 cfm (4719 L/s) …………………….…………….. $19.35 

6. Evaporative Coolers 
For each evaporative cooler other than portable type ….…………………….…………… $11.45 

7. Ventilation and Exhaust 
For each ventilation fan connected to a single duct ……………………….……………….. $7.65 
For each ventilation system which is not a portion of any heating or air-conditioning system  
authorized by a permit …………………………………………….………………….…… $11.45 
For the installation of each hood which is served by mechanical exhaust, including the ducts 
for such hood ……………………………………………………………………………… $11.45 

8. Incinerators 
For the installation or relocation of each domestic-type incinerator …..………………….. $19.35 
For the installation or relocation of each commercial or industrial-type incinerator ……... $29.00 
 

9. Miscellaneous 
When Chapter 13 is applicable, permit fees for fuel gas piping shall be: 
For each gas piping system of one to four outlets …………………………………………. $5.35 
For each additional outlet exceeding four, each …………...……………….……………… $1.30 
When Chapter 14 is applicable, permit fee for process piping shall be as follows: 
For each hazardous piping system (HPP) of one to four outlets …………………..……… $5.60 
For each hazardous process piping of five or more outlets, for each outlet  ……..…..…… $1.30 
For each non-hazardous process piping system (NPP) of one to four outlets …..…...……. $2.15 
For each non-hazardous piping system of five or more outlets, per outlet  …….…….…..  $0.55 
For each appliance or piece of equipment regulated by the Mechanical Code but not classed in  
other appliance categories, or for which no other fee is listed in the table …………...…. $11.45 

Other Inspections and Fees 
1. Inspections outside of normal business hours, per hour (minimum charge–two hours) …$51.00* 
2. Re-inspection fees assessed under provisions of Section 116.6, per inspection … ...…... $51.00* 
3. Inspections for which no fee is specifically indicated, per hour  (minimum charge – two  
         hours)…………………………………………………………………………………….. $51.00* 
4.     Additional plan review required by changes, additions or revisions to plans or to plans  

for which an initial review has been completed (minimum charge – one-half hour)...…. $51.00* 
        *Or the total hourly cost to the jurisdiction, whichever is the greatest.  This cost shall include supervision, 
        overhead, equipment, hourly wages and fringe benefits of the employees involved. 
 
 Section 108.2.3 is hereby added, reading as follows: 
 
  

Section 108.2.3  Plumbing Permit Fee 
 
The fee for each Plumbing permit shall be as set forth Table 3-A herein.   
 

Table 3-A  Plumbing Permit Fees 
 
1. For issuing each permit …………………………………………………………………………………………….. $21.40 

2. For issuing each supplemental permit …………………………………………………………………………..…$10.70 

Unit Fee Schedule (in addition to items 1 and 2 above) 

1. For each plumbing fixture on one trap or a set of fixtures on one trap (including water, drainage 
Piping and backflow protection therefor) …………………………………………………………………………… $7.40 

2. For each building sewer and each trailer park sewer ……………………………………….…………………...$16.05 

3. Rainwater systems – per drain (inside building) ………………………………………………………………...... $7.40 

4. For each private sewage disposal system ……………………………………………………….………………..$26.70 

5. For each water heater and/or vent ……………………………………………………………………………….….$7.40 

6. For each gas piping system of one to five outlets ……………………………………………………………...….$5.35 

 



 

7. For each additional gas piping system outlet, per outlet …………………………………………………….…... $1.30 

8. For each industrial waste pretreatment interceptor including its trap and vent, except kitchen-type 
grease interceptors functioning as fixture traps ………………………………………………………………...….$7.40 

9. For each installation, alteration or repair of water piping and/or water treating equipment, each ………..…..$7.40 

10. For each repair or alteration of drainage or vent piping, each fixture ………………………………………...… $7.40 

11. For each lawn sprinkler system on any one meter including backflow protection devices ………………...… $7.40 

12. For atmospheric-type vacuum breakers not included in item 12: 

1 to 5 …………………………………………………………………………………………………………….....$5.35 

over 5, each …………………………………………………………………………………………………....….$1.30 

13. For each backflow protective device other than atmospheric type vacuum breakers: 

2 inch (51 mm) diameter and smaller ……………………………………………………………………..…....$7.40 

over 2 inch (51 mm) diameter …………………………………………………………………………….……$16.05 

14. For each graywater system ……………………………………………………………………………………....….$42.75 

15. For initial installation and testing for a reclaimed water system ……………………….…...………………..…$32.05*  

16. For each annual cross-connection testing of a reclaimed water system (excluding initial test) …………....$32.05* 

17. For each medical gas piping system serving one to five inlet(s)/outlet(s) for a specific gas ……………...…$53.40 

18. For each additional medical gas inlet(s)/outlet(s) …………………………………………………………………..$5.35 

Other Inspections and Fees 

1. Inspections outside of normal business hours ……………………………………………………..…………..….$51.00* 

2. Re-inspection fees assessed under provisions of Section 103.5.6, per inspection ….……………………...…$51.00 

3. Inspections for which no fee is specifically indicated ………………………………………………………….….$51.00* 

4. Additional plan review required by changes, additions or revisions to approved plans 
(minimum charge – one-half hour) ……………………………………………………………………………….….$51.00* 

*Per hour for each hour worked or the total hourly cost to the jurisdiction, whichever is greater.  This cost shall include supervision, 

overhead, equipment, hourly wages and fringe benefits of all the employees involved. 

 
Section 108.6 is hereby added, reading as follows: 
 
Section 108.6 Fee Refunds 
 
The Building Official may authorize the refunding of fees as follows. 
1. The full amount of any fee paid hereunder which was erroneously paid or collected. 
2. Not more than 80 percent of the permit fee paid when no work has been done under a 

permit issued in accordance with this code. 
3. Not more than 80 percent of the plan review fee paid when an application for a permit 

for which a plan review fee has been paid is withdrawn or canceled before any plan 
review effort has been expended. 

 
The building official shall not authorize the refunding of any fee paid, except upon 
written application filed by the original permittee not later than 180 days after the date of 
fee payment. 
 
Section 112, Board of Appeals, is amended to read as follows: 
 
Section 112.1 General – Appeal Board of Adjustment. In order to hear and decide 
appeals of orders, decisions or determinations made by the building official relative to the 

 



 

application and interpretation of this code, the Appeal Board of Adjustment, as 
established by LMC chapter 19.12, shall have jurisdiction as provided in said chapter 
19.12.   
 
Section 113, Violations, is amended to read as follows:  
 
Section 113.1 Unlawful acts.  It shall be a misdemeanor for any person, firm or 
corporation to erect, construct, alter, extend, repair, move, remove, demolish or occupy 
any building, structure or equipment regulated by this code, or cause same to be done, in 
conflict with or in violation of any of the provisions of this code. 

 
 
16.02.030 Additions, insertions, deletions and changes to WAC chapter 51-51: 
The following sections of the International Residential Code as set forth in Washington 
Administrative Code chapter 51-51 are hereby amended to read as follows: 
 
  Chapter 1 of WAC 51-51 is deleted in its entirety.  
 

Table R301.2(1) Climatic, and Geographic Design Criteria established: 
 
 Ground Snow Load:    25 psf 
 
 Wind Speed (mph):    85 
 
 Seismic Design Category:   D1 
 
 Subject to Damage From Weathering  Moderate 
 

   Frost Line Depth:    12 inches 
 
   Termite:     Slight to Moderate 
 
   Decay:      Slight to Moderate 
 
   Winter Design Temp:    20 Degrees F  
 
   Ice Shield Underlayment Req.:  No 
 
   Flood Hazards:    NFIP November 20, 1979 
         FIRM December 20, 2001 
 
   Air Freezing Index:    N/A 
 
   Mean Annual Temperature:   50 Degrees F  
 

 



 

Section R310.5 Obstructions prohibited in the required side yard setback for R-1, 
R-2, R-3, R-4 and S-R districts. 
 
 The placement of air conditioners, heat pumps, radio/TV antennas, and 
 similar equipment of structures shall not be permitted in the required side 
 yard setback areas in R-1, R-2, R-3, R-4, and S-R districts except for side 
 yards located on flanking streets. 

 
16.02.040 Additions, insertions, deletions and changes to WAC chapter 51-52: 
 
  Chapter 1 of WAC 51-52 is deleted in its entirety. 
 
16.02.060 Additions, insertions, deletions and changes to WAC chapter 51-56: 
 
  Chapter 1 of WAC 51-56 is deleted in its entirety. 
 

Sec. 605.2 Valves, is amended to read as follows:  
A fullway valve controlling all outlets shall be installed on the discharge side of each 
water meter and on each unmetered water supply. Water piping supplying more than one 
building on any one premises shall be equipped with a separate fullway valve to each 
building, so arranged that the water supply can be turned on or off to any individual or 
separate building; provided however, that supply piping to a single family residence and 
building accessory thereto, may be controlled on one valve. All required shutoff or 
control valves shall be readily accessible. The valve controlling all outlets on the 
discharge side of the water meter shall be located within 18 inches of said meter, or at an 
otherwise well marked location as approved by the Administrative Authority. A fullway 
valve shall be installed on the discharge piping from water supply tanks at or near the 
tank. A fullway valve shall be installed on the cold water supply pipe to each water 
heater at or near the water heater. 
 
Section 610.8.1 Meter Size and building supply pipe, is amended to read as follows: 
The size of the meter and building supply pipe shall be determined as follows: 
(1) Determine the available pressure at the water meter or other source of supply; 
(2) Subtract one-half (1/2) pound per square inch pressure (3.4 kPa) for each foot (305 
mm) of difference in elevation between such source of supply and highest water supply 
outlet in the building or on the premises; 
(3) Use the “pressure range” group within which this pressure will fall using Table 6-5; 
(4) Select the “length” column which is equal to or longer than the required length; 
(5) Follow down the column to a fixture unit value equal to or greater than the total 
number of fixture units required by the installation; 
(6) Having located the proper fixture unit value for the required length, sizes of meter and 
building supply pipe as found in the two left hand columns shall be applied. Final 
determination of water meter size shall be by the Department of Public Works. No 
building supply pipe shall be less than three-quarter (3/4) inch (20 mm) in diameter. 
 
Section 719.1 Clean-outs, is amended to read as follows:  

 



 

Cleanouts shall be placed outside the building near the connection between the building 
drain and the building sewer and extended to grade. Additional building sewer cleanouts 
shall be installed at intervals not to exceed one hundred (100) feet (30480 mm) in straight 
runs, for each aggregate horizontal change in direction exceeding one hundred thirty-five 
(135) degrees (2.36 rad), and at the property line. Cleanouts located at the property line 
shall be provided with an approved cleanout access box. 

 
Sec. 1011.0 Auto Wash Racks, is amended to read as follows: 
Minimum Requirements for Auto Wash Racks.  
Every private or public wash rack and/or floor or slab used for cleaning machinery or 
machine parts shall be adequately protected against storm or surface water and shall drain 
or discharge into an approved oil/water separator (clarifier), acceptable to the 
jurisdiction, connected to the sanitary sewer system. 
 
Sec. 1014.0  Grease Traps, is amended to read as follows: 
Amended Grease Traps and Grease Interceptors 
When, in the judgement of the Administrative Authority, waste pretreatment is required, 
an approved type grease trap complying with the provisions of this section shall be 
installed and at all times kept in proper working order in the waste line leading from 
sinks, drains, and other fixtures or equipment in the following establishments: 
restaurants, cafes, lunch counters, cafeterias, bars and clubs, hotels, hospitals, 
sanitariums, factory or school kitchens, or other establishments where grease may be 
introduced into the drainage or sewer-age system in quantities that can effect line 
stoppage or hinder sewage treatment or private sewage disposal. A grease interceptor is 
not required for individual dwelling units or for any private living quarters. Plans shall be 
submitted to and approval obtained from the Administrative Authority prior to the 
installation of any waste pretreatment facilities in any food establishment set forth in this 
section. 
 

 SECTION 2. That chapter 16.01 of the Longview Municipal Code shall be, and is hereby, 
amended by the addition of a new section thereto, to be designated as section 16.010.005, 
reading as follows: 

 
  16.01.005: Limited Applicability of Chapter: 
  This chapter of the Longview Municipal Code shall be applicable to permits issued prior 

 to July 1, 2004, and to permits issued thereafter for which complete applications and the 
 payment of all fees occurred prior to said date. This Chapter shall be inapplicable to any 
 activities hereunder except as provided in this section. 

 
 
 SECTION 3. That chapter 16.03 of the Longview Municipal Code shall be, and is hereby, 

amended by the addition of a new section thereto, to be designated as section 16.03.005, reading 
as follows: 

 
  16.03.005: Limited Applicability of Chapter: 

 



 

  This chapter of the Longview Municipal Code shall be applicable to permits issued prior 
 to July 1, 2004, and to permits issued thereafter for which complete applications and the 
 payment of all fees occurred prior to said date. This Chapter shall be inapplicable to any 
 activities hereunder except as provided in this section. 

 
 SECTION 4. That chapter 16.04 of the Longview Municipal Code shall be, and is hereby, 

amended by the addition of a new section thereto, to be designated as section 16.04.005, reading 
as follows: 

 
  16.04.005: Limited Applicability of Chapter: 
  This chapter of the Longview Municipal Code shall be applicable to permits issued prior 

 to July 1, 2004, and to permits issued thereafter for which complete applications and the 
 payment of all fees occurred prior to said date. This Chapter shall be inapplicable to any 
 activities hereunder except as provided in this section. 

 
 
 SECTION 5. That chapter 16.05 of the Longview Municipal Code shall be, and is hereby, 

amended by the addition of a new section thereto, to be designated as section 16.05.005, reading 
as follows: 

 
  16.05.005: Limited Applicability of Chapter: 
  This chapter of the Longview Municipal Code shall be applicable to permits issued prior 

 to July 1, 2004, and to permits issued thereafter for which complete applications and the 
 payment of all fees occurred prior to said date. This Chapter shall be inapplicable to any 
 activities hereunder except as provided in this section. 

 
 SECTION 6. That chapter 16.06 of the Longview Municipal Code shall be, and is hereby, 

amended by the addition of a new section thereto, to be designated as section 16.06.005, reading 
as follows: 

 
  16.06.005: Limited Applicability of Chapter: 
  This chapter of the Longview Municipal Code shall be applicable to permits issued prior 

 to July 1, 2004, and to permits issued thereafter for which complete applications and the 
 payment of all fees occurred prior to said date. This Chapter shall be inapplicable to any 
 activities hereunder except as provided in this section. 

 
 
 SECTION 7. That chapter 16.07 of the Longview Municipal Code shall be, and is hereby, 

amended by the addition of a new section thereto, to be designated as section 16.07.005, reading 
as follows: 

 
  16.07.005: Limited Applicability of Chapter: 
  This chapter of the Longview Municipal Code shall be applicable to permits issued prior 

 to July 1, 2004, and to permits issued thereafter for which complete applications and the 
 payment of all fees occurred prior to said date. This Chapter shall be inapplicable to any 
 activities hereunder except as provided in this section. 

 



 

 
SECTION 8. This ordinance is hereby declared and designated as a public 
emergency ordinance necessary for the protection of public health, public safety, 
public property or the public peace, and shall be effective upon the adoption hereof 
by the City Council and the signature of the Mayor. 

 Approved by   votes of the City Council this _____ day of June , 2004. 

 Approved by the Mayor this _____ day of   , 2004. 
 
 
              
         M A Y O R 
APPROVED AS TO FORM: 
 
     
City Attorney 
 
ATTEST: 
 
     
City Clerk 
 

 
 

 



AGENDA SUMMARY SHEET
Business of the City Council 

City of Longview, Washington 
 

 
 
SUBJECT TITLE: 
Ordinance No.2895 amending LMC 16.13.040 
Section 1504(5) regarding Readerboard Signs 
 
 
EXHIBITS: 
Ordinance No.2895 
 
 
COUNCIL GOAL ADDRESSED: 
 
 
PRESENTED BY: 
Edwin R. Ivey, City Manager 

 
Agenda Item: 10B 
 
Dept. of Origin: Community Development 
 
For Agenda of: June 24, 2004 
 
Clearances: 
Originator:  John Brickey, Ass’t Director CD 
 
City Atty Review Necessary? Yes 
 
Date/Initials of City Attorney: dcs 6/8/04 
 
Asst. City Manager:    
 

 

 
SUMMARY STATEMENT: 
 
This Ordinance will permit the installation of changeable copy signs such as Parent Teacher Student 
Association informational signs at schools, motel advertisement of rates and specials, electronic market and 
membership information signs for banks, and similar such signs subject to the sign restrictions applicable to 
each zoning district.   
 
As Longview’s Comprehensive Plan update process progresses and zoning regulations are revised, it is staff’s 
recommendation that the sign provisions of each zoning district also be updated to include additional regulatory 
provisions as appropriate for readerboards, specifically taylored to each district. 
 
RECOMMENDED ACTION: 
Motion to adopt Ordinance No. 2895 amending Longview Municipal Code 16.13.040, Section 1504(5) relating 
to readerboards . 
 



 
 

ORDINANCE NO. 2895 
              
 
 An Ordinance amending Section16.13.040 of the Longview Municipal Code Subsection 
1504(5), relating to signs that employ changeable copy within the Downtown Commerce District 
D-C. 
              
 
 The City Council of the City of Longview do ordain as follows: 
 
Section 1. That section 16.13.040 subsection 1504(5) of the Longview Municipal Code, shall be, 
and is hereby, amended to read as follows: 
 
Sec. 16.13.040 subsection 1504(5). 
 
Within the Downtown commerce District D-C, readerboard signs, reader panel signs, bulletin 
board signs or similar advertising devices that employ changeable copy, are prohibited except as 
permitted in Chapter 19.52 LMC.  
 
Section 2. This ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after thirty (30) days of its 
passage and publication as provided by law. 
 
Passed by the City Council this     day of June, 2004. 
 
 Approved by the Mayor this    day of June, 2004. 
 
 
             
         MAYOR 
 
 ATTEST: 
 
       
  City Clerk 
 
 APPROVED AS TO FORM: 
 
       
  City Attorney 
 
Published:      
 



AGENDA SUMMARY SHEET
Business of the City Council 

City of Longview, Washington 
 

 
SUBJECT TITLE: 
Ordinance No. 2896, adopting and amending the 
International Fire Code.  
 
 
EXHIBITS: 
Ordinance No. 2896 
 
 
COUNCIL GOAL ADDRESSED: 
 
 
PRESENTED BY: 
Edwin R. Ivey, City Manager 

Agenda Item: 10C 
 
Dept. of Origin: Fire Department 
 
For Agenda of: June 24, 2004 
 
Clearances: 
Originator:  Jim Kambeitz, Fire Marshal 
 
City Atty Review Necessary? Yes 
 
Date/Initials of City Attorney: dcs 6/9/04 
 
Asst. City Manager:    
 

 

 
SUMMARY STATEMENT: 
The Legislature of the State of Washington has enacted RCW Chapter 19.27 which adopted the International 
Fire Code, with an implementation date of July 1, 2004.  The adopted code will be applicable throughout the 
State of Washington, in all counties and cities, in substitution and replacement of the Uniform Fire Code.  Local 
amendments are consistent with the International Fire Code and previous local amendments.  The local 
amendments that are proposed serve to clarify and standardize those sections of the Fire Code that are not 
specific or otherwise addressed.  The permit fees reflected in this code adoption are the same fees currently 
assessed with no increase proposed at this time. 
 
 
RECOMMENDED ACTION: 
Motion to adopt Ordinance No. 2896 adopting chapters 51-54 of the Washington Administrative Code as 
amended, declaring an emergency and providing that this ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and 
after July 1, 2004. 



 

 

Ordinance No. 2896 
              
 
 An Ordinance adopting chapter 51-54, of the Washington Administrative Code, 
regulating, governing and safeguarding of life and property from fire and explosion hazards 
arising from the storage, handling and use of hazardous substances, materials and devices, and 
from  conditions hazardous to life or property in the occupancy of buildings and premise as 
herein provided; providing for the issuance of permits and collection fees therefore; creating a 
new chapter in the Longview Municipal Code to be designated as chapter 18.10; providing that 
Longview Municipal Code chapter 18.08 shall be applicable to permits issued prior to July 1, 
2004, and amending chapter 18.08, by the addition of a new section to said chapter, and 
declaring an emergency and providing that this ordinance shall be in full force and effect from 
and after July 1, 2004. 
 
              
 
 WHEREAS, the Legislature of the State of Washington has enacted RCW chapter 19.27 
which adopted the International Fire Code, and provided that such code shall be applicable 
throughout the State of Washington, in all counties and cities, in substitution and replacement of 
all prior codes; and 
 
 WHEREAS, the Washington State Building Codes Council has adopted, in the 
Washington State Administrative Code, chapter 51-54 (International Fire Code); and 
 
 WHEREAS, by reason of such enactment, it is necessary that the City of Longview adopt 
such code; and 
 
 WHEREAS, permits issued prior to the effective date of this Ordinance, or for which 
complete applications were submitted prior to such effective date, should be governed by the 
provisions of the then existing fire code, and the provisions of the International Fire Code should 
be applicable only to permits for which application is made after the effective date of this 
Ordinance and/or for construction activities not conducted pursuant to permits for which 
application was made prior to the effective date of this Ordinance; and 
 
 WHEREAS, the effective date of the application of such International Code has been set 
at July 1, 2004 by the Washington State Legislature, and in order to provide for such an effective 
date of this Ordinance, it is necessary that the City Council declare an emergency in order to 
provide that this Ordinance shall become effective and in full force and effect on and after July 
1, 2004; 
 
 NOW, THEREFORE, the City Council of the City of Longview, Washington, do ordain 
as follows: 
 
SECTION 1. That Title 18 of the Longview Municipal Code shall be and is hereby amended by 
the addition of a new chapter thereto, to be designated as Chapter 18.10, reading as follows: 
 



 

 

18.10.010 Adoption of International Fire Code. 
 That Washington State Administrative Code chapter 51-54 ( 2003 International Fire 
Code), and appendices B, E, F and G to said International Fire Code, together with all future 
amendments thereof and additions thereto, one (1) copy of which is on file in the office of the 
City clerk of the City of Longview, shall be and is hereby adopted as the Fire Code of the City of 
Longview for regulating, governing and safeguarding of life and property from fire and 
explosion hazards arising from the storage, handling and use of hazardous substances, materials 
and devices, and from  conditions hazardous to life or property in the occupancy of buildings and 
premise as herein provided; providing for the issuance of permits and collection of fees 
therefore; and each and all of the regulations, provisions, penalties, conditions and terms of said 
Fire Code on file in the office of the City Clerk of the City of Longview are hereby referred to, 
adopted, and made a part hereof, as if fully set out in this Ordinance, with the additions, 
insertions, deletions and changes, if any, prescribed in this chapter. As used in this chapter the 
term “Fire Code” shall mean the International Fire Code hereby adopted by this chapter. 
 
18.10.020 Additional definitions. 
 (1)  Whenever the word “jurisdiction” is used in this chapter (Fire Code), or   
 in appendices B, E, F, and G, it shall mean the City of Longview. 
 
 (2)  Whenever the words “department of fire prevention” are used in this   
 chapter (Fire Code), or in appendices B, E, F, and G, they shall mean the   
 fire prevention division of the Longview Fire Department. 
 

(3) Whenever the words “fire code official” are used in this chapter (Fire Code), or in 
appendices B, E, F, and G, they shall mean the fire marshal of the Longview Fire 
Department.  

 
18.10.030 Smoke alarms – RCW adopted by reference. 

RCW 48.48.140 is adopted by reference. A copy thereof shall be filed in the office of 
the city clerk/director of finance for use and examination by the public. 

 
18.10.040 Family child day care homes. 

The purpose of this section is to provide minimum standards of safety for family 
child day care homes. 

(1) Family child day care home defined. A “family child day care home” is a child 
day care facility, licensed by the State of Washington, licensed in the family abode of 
the person or persons under whose direct care and supervision the child is placed, for 
the care of 12 or fewer children, including children who reside at the home. 

(2) Permit required. A permit shall be obtained from the fire department prior to 
operating any family child day care home operation within the city limits. 



 

(3) Approval by Building Code. Family child day care home operations shall be 
conducted only in structures approved for habitation by the building code. 

(4) Exiting. All rooms used for day care purposes shall be provided with at least two 
exits, one of which may be an openable escape and rescue window meeting the 
requirements of the building code. 

(5) Fire protection. Family child day care homes shall be provided with at least one 2-
A, 10-BC portable fire extinguisher installed and maintained in accordance with the 
fire code. 
(6) Automatic smoke detector. Every sleeping area shall be protected by an operational 
automatic smoke detector installed in accordance with its listing. 

 
18.10.050 Building plans – Submitted to fire marshal. 

When plans are submitted to the building department of the city for a permit to 
construct a building of other than single-family or duplex residence use, the plans will 
also be submitted to the fire marshal for approval of fire and life safety requirements 
set forth in the International Building Code, the International Fire Code and any other 
such provisions of the Longview Municipal Code.  

 

18.10.060 Fire code permit, plan review and inspection fees. 

(1)  For installation or alteration of any of the required construction permits as 
listed in the Fire Code, Section 105.7, a permit fee will be assessed based on 
value as amended by LMC Chapter 16.02, Table 1-A. 

(2) Plan review fees for required construction permits shall be 70 percent of the 
permit fee. 

(3)  A fee of $51.00 shall be collected for all operational permits required by the 
Fire Code, Section 105. Where more than one operational permit is required at 
the same premise the fee for each additional permit shall be one-half of the 
original fee. 

(4) A fee of $51.00 shall be collected for all special event reviews and inspections 
for the purpose of reviewing fire department access routes, general fire 
protection requirements, life safety requirements or other reviews conducted 
pursuant to the international codes, standards and ordinances adopted by the 
city. 

(5)  A fee of $15.00 shall be collected annually for the inspection of certificate of 
occupancy permits required under International Building Code Chapter 1, 
Section 110. 

 



 

(6) Building plan review fees as required by LMC 18.10.050 for calculation of 
required fire flows, review of fire department access routes, general fire 
protection requirements, life safety requirements or other reviews conducted 
pursuant to the international codes, standards and ordinances adopted by the 
city shall be five percent of the building permit fee designated by LMC 
Chapter 16.02, Table 1-A, except for group R-3 and U occupancies. 

(7)  Re-inspections, preliminary inspections and other special inspections required 
or requested shall be calculated at $51.00 per hour. 

 
18.10.070 Establishment of limits of districts in which storage of flammable or combustible 
liquids in outside above-ground tanks is to be prohibited. 
 (1)  The limits referred to in Section 3404.2.9.5.1 of the Fire Code in which   
 storage of flammable or combustible liquids in outside above-ground   
 tanks is prohibited are established as follows: All of the classified use   
 districts listed in LMC 19.15.010, except manufacturing district M-1,   
 manufacturing district M-2, and redevelopment project district RPD;   
 provided, however, that class II combustible liquids in quantities not   
 exceeding 660 gallons may be stored in all use districts of the city for the   
 purpose of providing electrical generation power for emergency systems   
 as defined by the National Electrical Code (LMC chapter 16.23), in above-  
 ground tanks which are listed as both “protected” and “fire-resistant” in   
 accordance with UL Standard 2085, approved by the fire prevention   
 division, and subject to the provisions of Chapter 34 of the Fire Code. 
 
 (2) The limits referred to in Section 3406.2.4.4 of the Fire Code, where   
 flammable or combustible liquids are prohibited, are established as   
 follows: All of the classified use districts as listed in LMC 19.15.010,   
 except for manufacturing district M-1, manufacturing district M-2, and   
 redevelopment project district RPD. 
 
18.10.080 Establishment of limits of districts in which storage of liquefied petroleum gas is 
to be restricted. 
 (1) The limits referred to in Section 3804.2 of the Fire Code, in which bulk   
 storage of liquefied petroleum gas is restricted, are as follows: All of the   
 classified use districts listed in LMC 19.15.010, except for manufacturing   
 district M-1, manufacturing district M-2 and redevelopment project   
 district RPD. 
 
 (2) Retail sales of liquefied petroleum gas shall be restricted in all classified   
 use districts listed in LMC 19.15.010 except for manufacturing district M-  
 1-A, M-1, M-2, redevelopment project district RPD, commercial districts   
 C-1, C-2, C-3, and C-4. The maximum capacity for storage containers in   
 C-1, C-2, C-3 and C-4 district shall be 1,200 gallons water capacity. 
 

 



 

18.10.090 Establishment of limits of districts in which storage of flammable cryogenic 
fluids in stationary containers is to be prohibited. 

The limits referred to in Section 3204.3.1.1 of the Fire Code, in which storage of 
flammable cryogenic fluids in stationary containers is prohibited, are established as 
follows: All of the classified use districts listed in LMC 19.15.010 except for 
manufacturing district M-1, manufacturing district M-2 and redevelopment project 
district RPD. 

 
18.10.100 Additions, insertions, deletions and changes to WAC chapter 51-54 (Fire Code): 
 

(1) Section 101.1 of the Fire Code is amended to read as follows: 
 
  101.1 Title.  
  These regulations shall be known as the Fire Code of the City of    
 Longview, hereinafter sometimes referred to in this chapter as “this code.” 
 
 (2) Section 105.7 of the Fire Code is amended to read as follows: 
 
  105.7 Required construction permits. 

The fire code official is authorized to issue construction permits for work as set 
forth in Sections 105.7.1 through 105.7.14 
  

 (3) Section 105.7.13 of the Fire Code is added to read as follows: 
 
  105.7.13 Refrigeration systems. 

A construction permit is required for installation or modification to a mechanical 
refrigeration system having a refrigerant circuit containing more than 220 pounds 
(100kg) of Group A1 or 30 pounds (14kg) of any other group refrigerant. 
  

 (4) Section 105.7.14 of the Fire Code is added to read as follows: 
 
  105.7.14 Technical assistance. 

A construction permit is required for the technical assistance provisions of the 
Fire Code in accordance with Section 104.7.2.  

  
(5) Section 108.1 of the Fire Code is amended to read as follows: 
 
 108.1 Appeal Board of Adjustment. 
 The Appeal Board of Adjustment, as created and established in LMC 
 19.12.010, is hereby empowered to hear and decide appeals of orders,
 decisions, or determinations made by the fire code official relative to the 
 application and interpretation of this Fire Code.  
 

 



 

(6) Section 109.3 of the Fire Code is amended to read as follows: 
 
  109.3 Violation penalties. 
  Persons who shall violate a provision of this Fire Code or who shall fail to  
  comply with any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect, install,   
 alter, repair or do work in violation of the approved construction    
 documents or directives of the fire code official, or of a permit or    
 certificate used under provisions of this Fire Code, shall be guilty of a   
 misdemeanor. Each day that a violation continues after due notice has   
 been served shall be deemed a separate offense. 
 

(7) Section 111.4 of the Fire Code is amended to read as follows: 
  
 111.4 Failure to comply. 
 Any person who shall continue any work after having been served with a  stop 
work order, except such work as that person is directed to perform to remove a violation 
or unsafe condition, shall be guilty of a misdemeanor. 
 
(8) Section 503 of the Fire Code is amended to read as follows: 

 

The provisions of WAC 51-54-500 that restates section 503.1 and deletes 
Sections 503.1.1, 503.1.2, 503.1.3, 503.4, 503.3, and 503.4, is deleted and 
retained by the city.  

 

(9) Section 503.2.3 of the Fire Code is amended to read as follows:  

 

503.2.3 Surface. 

Fire apparatus access roads shall have an unobstructed width of 20 feet, and 
provided with an all-weather driving surface a minimum of 16 feet in width 
designed and engineered to support the imposed loads of fire apparatus. 
Unless otherwise approved by the fire code official, an all-weather surface 
shall mean well maintained and paved or otherwise hard-surfaced with 
asphaltic or Portland cement concrete. 

 

 



 

(10) Section 503.2.5 of the Fire Code is amended to read as follows:  

503.2.5 Dead-ends. 

Dead-end fire apparatus access roads in excess of 150 feet length shall be 
provided with a turnaround. The turning radius of access roadway turnarounds 
shall be not less than 40 feet or 80 feet in diameter.  

Exception: Alternate methods of creating access roadway turnarounds may be 
approved by the fire code official on a temporary basis. Approved temporary 
turnarounds may include such designs as a hammerhead arrangement, a 
graveled circle 80 feet in diameter, or an intersecting road. 

 

 (11) Section 503.2.7 of the Fire Code is amended to read as follows: 

503.2.7 Grade.  

The gradient for a fire apparatus access road shall not exceed 15 percent. 

Exceptions: 

(a) Access roads leading to buildings fully protected by automatic sprinkler 
systems may exceed 15 percent grade. 

(b) When there is not more than two Group R, Division 3, or Group U 
Occupancies, the requirements of this section may be modified. 

      

  (12) Section 508.5 of the Fire Code is amended to read as follows: 

  508.5 Fire hydrant systems. 

Fire hydrant systems shall comply with Sections 508.5.1 through 508.5.10. 
 
(13) Section 508.5.2 of the Fire Code is amended to read as follows: 
  
 508.5.2 Inspection, testing and maintenance of fire hydrants. 

Fire hydrant systems shall be subject to periodic tests as required by the fire code 
official. Fire hydrant systems shall be maintained in an operative condition at all 
times and shall be repaired where defective. Hydrants shall be flow tested a 
minimum of every five years in a manner approved by the fire code official. Flow 
tests results shall be maintained by the city water department and made available 
upon request of the fire department. Additions, repairs, alterations and servicing 
shall comply with approved standards.      

 

 



 

(14) Section 508.5.3 of the Fire Code is amended to read as follows: 
 
 508.5.3 Private fire service mains and water tanks. 

Private fire service mains and water tanks shall be periodically inspected, tested 
and maintained in accordance with NFPA 25 at the following intervals: 

 
1. Private fire hydrants (all types): Inspection annually and after each operation; 
flow test and maintenance annually.  

 
2. Fire service main piping: Inspection of exposed, annually; flow test every 5 
years. 
 
3. Fire service main piping strainers: Inspection and maintenance after each use. 
 
Inspection, testing and maintenance of private fire service systems located on 
private property shall be the responsibility of the owner, lessee, or other person in 
charge of the premises. Records of required inspections, testing and maintenance 
shall be forwarded to the city water department not less than annually.  

 
(15) Section 508.5.7 of the Fire Code is added to read as follows: 
 
 508.5.7 Number and distribution of fire hydrants 

At least one hydrant shall be provided for each 1,500 gallons of required fire 
flow. Required hydrants shall be so located that a minimum of one hydrant is 
provided within 400 feet of all portions of exterior walls where openings are 
permitted by the building code. Unless determined by the fire code official to 
be impractical, all required fire hydrants shall be equally spaced not to exceed 
500 feet and placed a minimum distance of 40 feet from the structure or 
facility being protected as measured along fronting streets and fire apparatus 
access roadways. 

Exceptions: 

(a) Additional fire hydrants may be required when special hazards exist as 
described in Section 901.4.3 of the Fire Code. 

(b) Hydrants located on the opposite side of arterial streets, streets of four or 
more lanes, or streets provided with median dividers, which would prevent 
fire department access will not be considered as meeting fire flow 
requirements. 

(c) When a fixed water supply system is not available, an approved fire 
department mobile water supply may be considered as meeting minimum 
hydrant requirements for structures or facilities requiring less than 1,500 gpm 
fire flow. 

 



 

(d) Dead-end streets shall have at least one hydrant located within 250 feet of 
the street end; 

(e) When fire department connections are required, one hydrant shall be 
located within 100 feet of the fire department connection unless otherwise 
approved by the chief due to impractical conditions. 

 

(16) Section 508.5.8 of the Fire Code is added to read as follows: 

 508.5.8 Water main size. 

Water mains serving fire hydrants shall be a minimum of six inches in 
diameter. Water mains installed to meet fire flow requirements shall be 
engineered to supply the required flow at a minimum of 20 psi. 

 
 (17) Section 508.5.9 of the Fire Code is added to read as follows: 
 
  508.5.9 Fire hydrant visibility 

Hydrants shall not be visibly obstructed or have hydrant visibility impaired 
within a distance of 50 feet along fronting streets or access roads where fire 
department vehicles may be responding. In areas where required hydrant 
visibility cannot be effectively maintained, approved signs or street markers 
may be installed.  

 
 (18) Section 508.5.10 of the Fire Code is added to read as follows: 
 
  508.5.10 Fire hydrant marking 

Fire hydrants located on public or private property where vehicles could be 
parked shall have all curbs painted yellow or otherwise appropriately marked 
by the owner, lessee or other person in charge of premises to prohibit parking 
or other uses within 15 feet of a hydrant. In cases where curbs do not exist, 
approved signs or street markers may be installed. All hydrants shall be 
painted yellow.  

  
 (19) Section 901.6.2 of the Fire Code is amended to read as follows: 
 
  901.6.2 Fire protection system maintenance records. 

Records of all system inspections, tests, and maintenance required by the 
referenced standards shall be maintained on the premises for a minimum of 3 
years and made available to the fire code official upon request. Records of 
required annual system inspections, tests, and maintenance shall be forwarded to 
the fire department annually.      

 
(20) Chapter 33 of the Fire Code is amended by the addition of the following sections: 

 



 

 
  3301.1 Scope. 

The possession, manufacture, storage, handling, sale and use of explosives 
and explosive materials shall be governed by chapter 296-52 WAC and this 
chapter. The manufacture or storage of explosives or explosive materials shall 
be prohibited in all of the classified use districts listed in LMC 19.15.010 
except for manufacturing district M-2 and for temporary storage at 
construction job sites for periods not to exceed one year. The manufacture, 
storage, handling, sale and use of fireworks shall be governed by chapter 212-
17 WAC and this chapter.        

 

3301.1.1 Common fireworks permitted. 

Notwithstanding any provision to the contrary contained in Section 3301.1 of 
the Fire Code, “common” fireworks, as permitted by WAC 212-17, shall be 
permitted within the City of Longview. 

 

3301.1.2 Adoption of State law by reference. 

As authorized by RCW 35A.13.180 and 35A.12.140, the city council hereby 
adopts by reference Chapter 70.77 of the Revised Code of Washington, 
entitled “State Fireworks Law,” together with amendments thereof and 
additions thereto. One copy of said RCW chapter 70.77 with amendments and 
additions thereto shall be filed in the office of the City Clerk/Director of 
Finance of said City for use and examination by the public. 

 

3301.1.3 Retail sales permit requirements. 

The number of retail sales permits which the city may issue for the sale of 
common fireworks in any one calendar year shall not exceed nine (9). No 
retail sales permit shall entitle the holder thereof to more than one location. 
All retail sales permits shall be nontransferable. The fire marshal or his 
designee shall make inspections and approvals of all retail sales locations to 
verify compliance with WAC 212-17 and the Fire Code prior to the conduct 
of sales from such locations. All retail sales locations shall be inspected 
between June 23 and June 28. It is the responsibility of the applicant to meet 
all legal requirements and to request inspection at least 24 hours in advance. 
Failure to comply with any of the provisions of WAC 212-17 or the Fire Code 
shall be grounds for revocation of a permit. 

 

 



 

3301.1.4 Retail sales permit fee 

The annual retail sales permit fee for each retail sales permit issued hereunder 
shall be $100.00, which shall be paid to the City Clerk at the time such license 
is issued. All retail sales permits shall expire at the end of the calendar year in 
which they are issued. Said fee shall be paid in full regardless of the month 
during any calendar year that said permit is issued and shall not be refunded. 

 

3301.1.5 Application for retail sales permit. 

All applications for retail sales permit to sell fireworks in the City: 

1. Shall be made on or prior to the second Tuesday in May of each year. 
Applicants for each such permit shall be notified by the fire code official of 
the fire department of the granting or rejection of their application for license 
on or before the first Monday in June of each calendar year. 

2. Shall set forth the proposed location of the fireworks stand from which such 
sales shall be made. 

3. Shall be accompanied by proof of insurance as specified in RCW 
70.77.270, and shall include an endorsement of such insurance naming the 
City as an insured thereunder. 

4. Shall be in writing; show the corporate name of the applicant, if any; be 
signed by duly authorized officer of the applicant; and contain the address to 
which the notice is to be sent by the fire code official of the fire department of 
the granting or rejecting of the application. 

 

3301.1.6 Preference. 

In granting retail sales permits hereunder, preference may be given to 
applicants who held permits for such sales issued by the City during the 
previous calendar year. 

 

3301.1.7 Copy of State license to be filed. 

Before a retail sales permit to sell fireworks or conduct a public display of 
fireworks shall be issued, the applicant for such permit shall file with the City 
Clerk of the City a copy of the license issued to such applicant by the State of 
Washington in accordance with RCW Chapter 70.77. 

 

 



 

SECTION 2. That chapter 18.08 of the Longview Municipal Code shall be, and is hereby, 
amended by the addition of a new section thereto, to be designated as section 18.08.005, 
reading as follows: 

 

 18.08.005 Limited Applicability of Chapter. 

 This chapter of the Longview Municipal Code shall be applicable to permits 
 issued prior to July 1, 2004, and to permits issued thereafter for which  complete 
applications and the payment of all fees occurred prior to said date.  This chapter shall 
be inapplicable to any activities hereunder except as  provided in this section. 

 
SECTION 3. This ordinance is hereby declared and designated as a public emergency ordinance 
necessary for the protection of public health, public safety, public property or the public peace, 
and shall be effective upon the adoption hereof by the City Council and the signature of the 
Mayor. 

 Approved by   votes of the City Council this _____ day of June, 2004. 

 Approved by the Mayor this _____ day of   , 2004. 
 
 
             
        M A Y O R 
APPROVED AS TO FORM: 
 
     
 City Attorney 
 
ATTEST: 
 
     
 City Clerk 

 



AGENDA SUMMARY SHEET
Business of the City Council 

City of Longview, Washington 
 

 
SUBJECT TITLE: 
Ordinance No. 2897 amending Longviw Municipal 
Code Section 12.30.090 subsection (1) relating to 
Sidewalk Business Licenses 
 
 
EXHIBITS: 
Ordinance No. 2897 
 
COUNCIL GOAL ADDRESSED: 
Downtown Revitalization 
Economic Development 
 
PRESENTED BY: 
Edwin R. Ivey, City Manager 

 
Agenda Item: 10D 
 
Dept. of Origin: Community Development 
 
For Agenda of: June 24, 2004 
 
Clearances: 
Originator:  John Brickey, Ass’t Director CD 
 
City Atty Review Necessary? Yes 
 
Date/Initials of City Attorney: dcs 6/7/04 
 
Asst. City Manager:    
 

 

 
SUMMARY STATEMENT: 
This Ordinance expands the area where Sidewalk Business Licenses are permitted to include the whole of the 
Downtown Commerce District D-C. 
 
The Downtown Advisory Committee supported this expansion/clarification at their April 23, 2004 meeting.  
 
 
RECOMMENDED ACTION: 
Motion to adopt Ordinance No. 2897 amending Longviw Municipal Code Section 12.30.090 subsection (1) 
relating to Sidewalk Business Licenses 



 
ORDINANCE NO. 2897

               
 
 An Ordinance amending section 12.30.090 subsection (1) relating to Sidewalk Business Licenses.  
The purpose of this ordinance is to clearly identify and expand the area within the city where Sidewalk 
Business Licenses may be issued to include all of the Downtown Commerce District DC. 
               

 
 The City Council of the City of Longview do ordain as follows: 
  
Section 1.  That Chapter 12.30.090 subsection (1) of the Longview Municipal Code shall be, and is 
hereby, amended to read as follows: 
 

Sec. 12.30.090(1). 
 
The sidewalk area lying immediately between a commercial building and the curb, within the 
Downtown Commerce District DC of the city, which building contains a currently licensed operating 
retail business engaged in the sales of good and merchandise, services, or the business of a restaurant, 
may upon the grant of a sidewalk business license hereunder, be used for the purpose of display and 
sales of goods and merchandise, or services, of a like kind and quality that is displayed and offered for 
sale within the abutting commercial building or the sale and consumption of food and beverages similar 
to that which is sold and consumed on the abutting premises. 
 
Section 2.  This ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after thirty (30) days of 
its passage and publication as provided by law.   
 
Passed by the City Council this     day of June, 2004. 

Approved by the Mayor this      day of June, 2004. 

 

              
         MAYOR 

ATTEST: 

       
City Clerk 

 
APPROVED AS TO FORM: 

 
       

City Attorney 
 

 
 
 



AGENDA SUMMARY SHEET
Business of the City Council 

City of Longview, Washington 
 

 
SUBJECT TITLE: 
Resolution No. 1794, Adopting the 2005-2010 Six 
Year Transportation Improvement Plan (TIP) 
 
EXHIBITS: 
Resolution No. 1794 
 
 
COUNCIL GOALS ADDRESSED: 
 
 
PRESENTED BY: 
Edwin R. Ivey, City Manager 

 
Agenda Item: 10E 
 
Dept. of Origin:  Public Works 
 
For Agenda of:  6/24/04  
 
Clearances: 
Originator:          Jeff Cameron, PW Director  
 
City Atty Review Necessary? Yes  
 
Date/Initials of City Attorney:   dcs/ss 6/15/04 
 
Asst. City Manager:    
 

 
 
SUMMARY STATEMENT: 
Following a public hearing on June 10, 2004 the City council directed the preparation of Resolution No. 1794, 
which adopts the 2005-2010 Six Year Transportation Improvement Program. 
 
 
 
RECOMMENDED ACTION: 
Motion to adopt Resolution No. 1794. 
 
 
 
 



RESOLUTION NO.  1794  
 

 
  

 A Resolution adopting a revised and extended six year Transportation Improvement 
Program (TIP) (2005 - 2010) for the City of Longview, Washington. 
 

  

WHEREAS, pursuant to the requirements of RCW 35.77.010 the City of Longview did, 

on August 22, 1968, adopt a Comprehensive Street Improvement Program, now known as the 

Transportation Improvement Program (TIP), for the ensuing six years; and 

 WHEREAS, pursuant to the further requirements of said statute, it is necessary that said 

City prepare and adopt a revised and extended six year Transportation Improvement Program 

(TIP) during the current year; and 

 WHEREAS, pursuant to said requirements said City has now prepared a revised and 

extended Transportation Improvement Program (TIP) for the next ensuing six years (2005 - 

2010) and said plan was presented to the City Council of said City on June 10, 2004; and 

 WHEREAS, the City Council of said City held the required public hearing thereon at 

7:00 p.m. at the City Hall in Longview, Washington on the 10th day of June, 2004; and 

 WHEREAS, no written or oral objections have been received to the revised 

Transportation Improvement Program (TIP) as prepared by the City of Longview relative to said 

street program for the next ensuing six years within said City.   

 NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the City Council of the City of Longview 

that the revised and extended Transportation Improvement Program (TIP) for the Urban Arterial 

Board, Transportation Improvement Board, Federal aid, and 1/2 cents Gas Tax Projects as 

prepared by the City Engineer for said City and submitted to the City Council of said City, a 

copy of which is hereto attached and marked Exhibit "A", are hereby, adopted as the Official 

Transportation Improvement Program (TIP) for said City for the next ensuing six years through 

December 31, 2010, subject to review, extension and revision on or before July 1, 2005, and 

annually thereafter, all as required by RCW 35.77.010. 

 BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that a copy of said Transportation Improvement 

Program (TIP), as shown on said Exhibit "A", together with a copy of this Resolution be filed 



with the Secretary of Transportation of the State of Washington not more than thirty (30) days 

after its adoption. PASSED by the City Council of the City of Longview in regular session and 

approved by the Mayor this 24th day of June, 2004. 

          

              
                M A Y O R 
ATTEST: 
 
 
      
City Clerk 
 



Item 12A 

APPROVAL OF CLAIMS 
 
Based upon the authentication and certification of claims and demands against 
the City, prepared and signed by the City’s auditing officer, and in full reliance 
thereon, it is moved and seconded as shown in the minutes of this meeting that 
the following vouchers/warrants are approved for payment: 
 
Voucher (warrant) totals for 2nd Claims of June 2004:  Total $1,054,083.96 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------- 
 

Pay Period:  June 1-15, 2004 
 

Payroll warrant numbers 187890 through 188014  Total  $158,460.83 
 
Payroll direct deposits       Total  $337,651.79 
 
Payroll wire transfers      Total  $239,832.87 
 
Total Payroll Amt        $735,945.49 
 
 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------- 
 
 



Council Agenda Item No. 12B 
June 24, 2004 

 
CLAIMS ACTIVITY 

 
New Claims 
  

Claimant 
Incident 
Date 

 
Incident Description 

Amount 
Claimed 

 None   
 
Settled Claims 
  

Claimant 
Incident 
Date 

 
Incident Description 

Amount  
Paid 

 None   
 
Denied Claims 
  

Claimant 
Incident 
Date 

 
Incident Description 

Amount 
Claimed 

1. Richard Longacre 4/29/04 Claimant alleged loss of use, 
expenses, and general damages due to 
an improper vehicle impoundment. 
 

Unspecified

 



Item 12C 
LONGVIEW PLANNING COMMISSION 

June 2, 2004 
 

Chairman Conrad Bankson called the regular meeting of the Longview Planning 
Commission to order at 7:00 p.m. in the City Hall Council Chambers, 1525 Broadway, 
Longview, Washington. 
 
1. ROLL CALL
 

Present: Conrad Bankson 
Jim Barnett 
Jim Fisher 
Barry Morrill  
DeAnne Nelson 
Patricia Price 
Lyle Smith 

 
Staff Present: Dave Spencer, City Attorney 

John Brickey, Assistant Director/Building Official 
Roy Hewson, City Engineer 
Chris Whiteside, Administrative Secretary 

 
Not Present:  Robert Millspaw, Principal Planner (Excused) 

 
 
2. APPROVAL OF MINUTES
 
Mrs. Price made a motion to approve the minutes of the regular meeting of May 5, 
2004.  The motion was seconded by Mr. Morrill and carried unanimously. 
  
3. AUDIENCE PARTICIPATION OR CORRESPONDENCE
 

Oral Communications.  Persons in the audience may discuss business 
not scheduled on this agenda on any item of interest within the jurisdiction 
of the Planning Commission.  The Commission will listen to all 
communication, but in compliance with the Washington Open Public 
Meetings Act, will not take any action on items that are not listed on the 
agenda. 

 
No oral communications were received for any items not listed on the agenda. 
 
 

Written Communications.  Correspondence for the Planning 
Commission received after preparation of this agenda. 

 



 
Planning Commission Meeting 2 June 2, 2004 Minutes 

Mr. Brickey stated that several letters had been received since the posting and publishing 
of the agenda and would be read into the record at the appropriate time on the agenda. 
 
4. DECLARATION OF EX PARTE COMMUNICATION AND 

APPEARNESS OF FAIRNESS DOCTRINE
 
After this was read into the record by Mr. Brickey, there was a question from a woman in 
the audience who asked what “deciding matters” meant.  Chairman Bankson explained 
that after the public hearing is conducted, if it is not continued to another date, the 
Planning Commission will make a recommendation to City Council of approval or 
denial.  
 
5. PUBLIC HEARINGS  
 
Prior to opening the public hearing, Mr. Bankson explained a few of the rules under 
which a public hearing is conducted.  He asked that all those giving testimony state their 
name and address for the record.  He also asked that the audience refrain from any 
unnecessary noise during the course of the meeting, such as clapping, cheering or booing. 
 Mr. Bankson conveyed that the Planning Commission appreciated the public’s interest 
and input, but emphasized the importance of maintaining an orderly meeting.  All 
comments received at the podium would be limited to two minutes and urged that items 
addressed not be repetitive.  
 
 

5.1 PC 2004-4, Text Amendment  
Petition by Jack Mandel, representing Lowe’s Companies, Inc. to 
amend the text of LMC 19.51.010, Uses permitted, C-4 Commercial 
District, by adding “home improvement stores” to this section. 
 

Mr. Brickey presented the staff report to the Planning Commission. 
A notice of public hearing was published on May 21, 2004 and May 30, 2004 in The 
Daily News, and property owners within 300 feet of the project were notified by mail.  In 
addition, the property was posted on May 21, 2004. 
 
Staff finds that the activities associated with a “home improvement retail store” or a 
“building supplies and lumber store” are considered appropriate land uses in the C-4 
Commercial District as it is presently written. 
Staff further finds that the intent of the C-4 Commercial District will not be compromised 
by the addition of building materials and lumber supplies to the Uses Permitted section. 
Staff further finds that there are other uses of land that are ancillary to the principal 
permitted uses of land that should also be permitted, as long as they remain ancillary to 
the principal use and are not the principal use. 
If the majority of the Planning Commission supports the amending of the text of the Uses 
Permitted section of LMC §19.51.010, a suggested text amendment is as follows (added 
text is underlined): 



 
Planning Commission Meeting 3 June 2, 2004 Minutes 

19.51.010 Uses permitted. 
 
In the commercial district, C-4, no building or premises shall be used nor 

shall any building or structure be hereafter erected or altered except for one 
or more of the following uses: 

(5) Building materials and lumber retail stores; garden supply stores; with 
ancillary contracting services customarily associated with such uses; 

 
If the decision and recommendation forwarded to the City Council by the 
Planning Commission is to amend the text of LMC §19.51.010(5), it will 
be heard by the council at their July 8, 2004 meeting. 
 

Noting the 14-day SEPA review and comment period which will expire on June 9, 2004, 
Mr. Fisher asked whether staff had received comments from any agencies.  Mr. Brickey 
replied that all comments would be directed to our Principal Planner, who is not available 
tonight.  He was unaware of any comments that may have been received, but offered to 
provide the Commission with the information if so requested.  Mr. Brickey commented 
that the SEPA process is a concurrent process and the Planning Commission is not 
required to hear those cases; however, if any Commissioners wanted to know what those 
comments were, a continuance of this hearing could be considered in order to have a 
chance to review all comments. 
 
At this point, there was a question from the audience about a packet that was being 
referred to.  Mr. Brickey explained that it was agenda packets, which are sent primarily to 
Planning Commission members only.  He noted that there are limited copies of the staff 
reports available, but if anyone were interested in obtaining a copy, to leave their name 
and number with staff.  He emphasized that the staff reports are not for public knowledge 
until the Planning Commission has acted upon it. 
 
Mr. Fisher added for the audience’s information that Mr. Brickey had just read the staff 
report in its entirety.   
 
To respond to Mr. Bankson’s question as to whether all C-4 zoning districts of the City 
would be affected if this text amendment were granted, Mr. Brickey affirmed that it 
would. 
 
Mr. Morrill asked how many other sites are available in our City meeting the lot size 
criteria for this type of use.  Noting that this case dealt primarily with a text amendment, 
Mr. Brickey advised Mr. Morrill that perhaps his question would be better addressed 
during the next item on the agenda, the rezone and Comprehensive Plan amendment 
request. 
 
Noting that Fred Meyer, up until recently, had a home improvement store, Mr. Barnett 
asked what zone it fell within and why this use has been allowed if it was not a permitted 
use in this zone.  Mr. Brickey informed Mr. Barnett that Fred Meyer had a home and 
garden store.  He remarked that he would have to do historical research to determine if 
there was a public process allowing this or whether it was grandfathered in. 
 



 
Planning Commission Meeting 4 June 2, 2004 Minutes 

Audience Participation 
 
Prior to receiving public comments, Mr. Bankson asked that all comments made be 
germane to just the text amendment being sought.   
 
Sid Klein, 1221 Spruce Street, Longview, did not feel that the two minute time limit was 
adequate to express what he felt.  He noted that a Determination of Non-Significance has 
already been declared for this proposed project.  Mr. Klein believes that the significance 
is great, and that an Environmental Impact Statement should be filed. This process would 
take about six months, but questions can be addressed during this time.  He urged 
Council to consider this step since the proposal is to remove an entire residential area out 
of this district.  Mr. Klein has no objections to Lowe’s coming into town, but he is 
adamantly opposed to a residential area that is close to the lake being used for that 
purpose.  He wondered why they do not move into the Mint Farm Industrial Park.  Mr. 
Klein reiterated the need for an Environmental Impact Statement, which would address 
traffic, other environmental issues as well as safety issues and noise in the neighborhood. 
 
Kathryn Smith, 2744 Maryland, Longview, disclosed that she misunderstood the 
information being discussed and asked for clarification.  Mr. Brickey explained that the 
request is for a text amendment that would specifically allow “home improvement stores” 
within areas already zoned C-4.   
 
Rick Johnson, 2316 Ocean Beach Highway, Longview, asked about the rezoning of C-4 
in that particular area.  He wondered whether Lowe’s would be allowed to sublet part of 
the property in question and build a restaurant, such as Carl’s Jr. or Boston Market.  Mr. 
Johnson wanted to know if restaurants were allowed in a C-4 zone.  As the proposal 
before the Planning Commission was a text amendment, Mr. Brickey asked Mr. Johnson 
to hold his question until the next case is considered.  
 
Ken Spring, 1618 Florence, Longview, felt that making a change from low density 
residential to C-4 was quite drastic and the craziest proposal he’s ever seen.  He stated 
that this is one of the busiest intersections in town and the accident rate would soar if this 
is approved.  Mr. Spring pointed out how much the traffic increased when the two new 
services stations at Fred Meyer and Safeway opened.  He cannot see anyone in their right 
mind changing the zone to allow this proposal at this location. 
 
To attempt to clarify the matter before the Planning Commission, Mr. Spencer explained 
the permitted land uses within the Zoning Code.  He stated that all that is being sought 
with this case is to simply change the language in the ordinance.  He emphasized that it 
had nothing to do with what the zone is in that location.  This is strictly a legislative 
matter.  
 
Barbara Freiberg, 1427 19th Avenue, Longview, stated that she just moved into the city 
from Willow Grove.  She opined that not allowing people to protest is ridiculous.  She 
felt that the only reason for the proposed change is to allow a big store to come in and 
establish themselves where they are not wanted.   



 
Planning Commission Meeting 5 June 2, 2004 Minutes 

She wanted the City to admit that it was only interested in the money.  She believes that 
the whole idea is foolish. 
 
Mr. Barnett assured the audience that everyone would have a chance to speak.  He 
remarked that the Commission is trying to get through this particular item, which is a text 
amendment.  This change would allow a home improvement store to locate in any C-4 
district of the City.  The rezoning is a separate issue which would be discussed later on 
the agenda.  He asked that everyone limit comments strictly to the text amendment. 
 
Mrs. Price added that what is being considered is an additional use of the C-4 zone; it has 
nothing to do with Lowe’s coming in.  She did not believe that the message was being 
conveyed. 
 
Janet Cooper, 1015 23rd Avenue, Longview, asked what the boundaries were for the 
property being changed to a C-4.   
 
Mr. Morrill explained that the rezoning of the property is not the item being considered 
by the Commission at the moment.  However, he was unsure why this particular issue 
came before the Planning Commission.  He stated that it was a matter of interpretation 
whether or not the new language was necessary, pointing out that Fred Meyer Store did 
have a home and garden center. 
 
Merrill Swanson, 2793 Ocean Beach Highway, Longview, told the Commission that he 
lived directly across the street from the proposed project.  He reported that he bought his 
house six years ago for $128,000.  Now Lowe’s is planning to buy the houses across the 
street for two and a half times their value, up to $300,000 to get the property for their 
store.  Mr. Swanson wanted to know how this would affect the property value of their 
homes across the street.  He also mentioned concern for traffic and other issues.  He 
declared that the area should remain residential.  Expressing himself quite vocally using  
inappropriate language, Mr. Swanson felt that Lowe’s should be ashamed of themselves 
for paying that kind of money and creating a rift between neighbors.  He shouted as he 
left the room that it was “all about the money!” 
 
Marsha Timmons, 2920 Maryland Street, Longview, pointed out that Fred Meyer may 
have been a home improvement store, but it is not a warehouse.  She stated that they were 
not opposed to a business going in to that location, but they were opposed to a warehouse 
being built in the neighborhood.  She remarked that there is quite a difference between 
Fred Meyer and Lowe’s.  Lowe’s does not have groceries or a deli.  She felt that people 
were against a box store in that area.  Mrs. Timmons asserted that anyone who was not 
opposed to Lowe’s should speak up too. 
 
James Gowen, 2027-A 46th Avenue, Longview, asked what the present zoning was for 
the area in question.  He thought that the discussion was a rezone.  He was reminded that 
the rezone request was the next item on the agenda. 
 



 
Planning Commission Meeting 6 June 2, 2004 Minutes 

John Philbrook, 6 Linda Lane, Longview, asked if Home Depot fell in a commercial 
zone.  Mrs. Price advised that it was located in a manufacturing zone.  If this text 
amendment were not approved, Mr. Philbrook wondered what would happen to Lowe’s 
request to build at that location.  Mr. Morrill opined that he did not believe the text 
amendment was necessary.  He feels that Fred Meyer is just as much a home 
improvement store as Lowe’s.  Mr. Barnett responded that it would definitely be a 
stumbling block for Lowe’s if this text amendment were declined.  Mr. Philbrook urged 
the Planning Commission not to approve the text amendment at this time. 
 
Ken Spring, spoke again.  Mr. Spring wanted to clarify that Fred Meyer no longer sells 
lumber, so it is completely different from Home Depot or Lowe’s and should not be 
considered a home improvement store.  It was mentioned that the text change was to add 
three words to the code, “home improvement store.”  Mr. Spring asserted that he was 
vehemently opposed to those three words being added. 
 
Board Discussion 
 
Mrs. Price felt that the text amendment would benefit other areas of the community.  She 
also believes that the change is appropriate for the zoning.  Mr. Bankson concurred. 
 
Hearing no other comments from the Commissioners, a motion was made and 
seconded to approve Case No. PC 2004-4, a request by Lowe’s Companies to amend 
the text of LMC 19.51.010 to add “home improvement district” to the C-4 
Commercial District.  There was a unanimous vote of approval.  The motion 
carried. 
 

5.2 PC 2004-5, Petition to Amend the Longview Comprehensive Plan and 
to Rezone Parcels from Residential to Commercial Uses 

 
Petition by Jack Mandel, representing Lowe’s Companies, Inc. To 
amend the Longview Comprehensive Plan (1993) from Low Density 
Residential land uses to General Commercial land uses, and rezone 12 
parcels in the 2800 block of Ocean Beach Highway (north side) from 
S-R Suburban Residential District and R-1 Residential District, to C-4 
Commercial District. 

Mr. Brickey presented the Planning Commission with the staff report.   

As previously stated on the agenda, Community Development received several letters 
regarding the proposal, and Mr. Brickey read them into the record: 

1. Harold Luhn 2927 Premiere Place – welcomes Lowe’s; does not feel it’s 
too close to the lake; no problem with the traffic.  Only concern is noise. 

2. Robert H. Elliott – too close to lake; does not want a super store in 
residential area.  Lowe’s should locate in a commercial area. 



 
Planning Commission Meeting 7 June 2, 2004 Minutes 

3. Mal Miller – 115 Green Acres Way, Castle Rock – In favor of the rezone. 
 Owns one of the largest parcels at 2782 Ocean Beach Highway.  Feels 
property is better used for commercial development.  Believes traffic will 
actually be reduced. 

4. Carey Ann Rider – grandmother was involved in traffic accident in the 
area; concern for safety for drivers because of added traffic and congestion 
and for noise during construction. 

5. Doris May White – 2807 Ocean Beach Highway – Ocean Beach Highway 
is already a busy street; this will make it even more dangerous.  Quality of 
life and property values will be destroyed.  Traffic, noise & lights in 
parking lot will render area unlivable.  Lowe’s should locate in the 
industrial site. 

6. E-mailed letter from Marjorie Kindell, #4 Terry Court – concerns or 
traffic and for loading and unloading after hours. 

7. Adam J. Wolfe, PhD, 2789 Ocean Beach Highway- Lowe’s can choose 
another site already zoned commercial.  No compelling reason to change 
the zone.  This will cause further erosion of traffic on Ocean Beach 
Highway.  Proposal will detract from area near a unique landmark, our 
lake. 

8. Randy & Rhonda Williams – Love their home where they have lived 
many years.  Do not want to look out their window and see big store.  
Also expressed concern for the traffic and property values being lowered. 

9. Form letter – Suggests that Lowe’s build in industrial site or behind 
Reynolds Credit Union near Walmart.  Longview already rated as a bad 
place to live.  This will make it worse.  Author unknown (illegible 
writing.) 

10. Ruth Ann Gregg, 2660 Maryland – Lives close to Ocean Beach Highway 
and does not feel Lowe’s will have a detrimental affect on the lake.  It 
cannot even be seen from the lake.  There are already existing retail 
commercial businesses on east end of lake.  Longview needs jobs, revenue 
and competition for local customers. 

11. Michael J. Hummels, 2790 Ocean Beach Highway suggests a buffer zone 
separating commercial from residential area.  Offers an idea to use church 
at 2746 Ocean Beach Highway as a buffer.  Another suggestion is to 
require Lowe’s to provide 50-100’ greenway between itself and residents 
and deed it to the City as a park. 

12. Donald Fuller, PhD – the area is becoming a de facto mall with a major 
highway running through it.  Traffic congestion growing, yet the access 
traffic control system remains unchanged.  Present housing costs and lack 
of low income housing make efforts to rezone residential into commercial 
seem counter productive.   



 
Planning Commission Meeting 8 June 2, 2004 Minutes 

Cannot believe that a successful site for a Lowe’s store can not be located 
within the boundaries of Longview. 

13. Harold Luhn, 2927 Premiere Place – contacted WRG  regarding noise 
mitigation and in a letter to the City, Mr. Luhn indicated that his concerns 
were somewhat addressed.  Read Stapleton of WRG responded that the 
noise levels would be reduced because deliveries will be restricted to day 
time hours; there will be no refrigeration loading trucks since Lowe’s does 
not sell refrigeration items; lumber truck deliveries will be limited to 2-3 
times a week; a concrete masonry wall will be built on north and east 
property line for noise and visual buffering; and rooftop heating and 
cooling units being proposed are designed to significantly reduce noise 
levels.  Mr. Steven Gale of Lowe’s reiterated the information provided by 
Mr. Stapleton and added that Lowe’s will provide 175-200 new jobs, 78% 
full time.  The wage rates would be significantly in excess of entry level. 

14. Patty Hightower, 2778 Ocean Beach Highway – urged the City to keep the 
area residential.  The Mint Farm is more centrally located, and since 
delivery trucks would use the truck routes on Industrial Way, this will 
ease the congestion on Ocean Beach Highway.   

15. Steve Hammond was not against Lowe’s, but he was against the location.  
 He cited traffic congestion and the quality of life being affected.  Lowe 
can find another site to locate. 

16. Dave Hendrickson, 3170 Pacific Way – Not against Lowe's coming to 
town, but against the location.  Existing traffic problem already on Ocean 
Beach Highway.  Adding more traffic lights will funnel more traffic on to 
Pacific Way.  Lowe’s can locate in Mint Farm or near Washington Way 
near Wood Shed. 

17. E-mail received from Art and Mary Birkmeyer – are against any 
compromise to zoning code to accommodate this type of development.  
Will set precedent to facilitate deterioration of environmental quality of 
the City.  Not against Lowe’s; against the location. 

18. Diane Flaskerud Soldier, 1329 8th Avenue – do not change zoning or land 
use.  Has seen this happen in big city.  Developers only have own self 
interest in mind.  There are other commercial properties where Lowe’s can 
locate. 

19. Another letter from Diane Soldier addressed to Councilman Kurt 
Anagnostou – Do not make any deals with developers.  They do not live 
here or care about our quality of life.  Do not change the zoning. 

Mr. Brickey advised the audience that a letter from Lowe’s Store to the Planning 
Commission members was received.  Additional copies were available in the back 
of the room, or staff can provide a copy if requested. 

Other letters read into the record that was part of agenda packet: 

 
20. David Street, 2803 Ocean Beach Highway – oppose change.  Not 

conducive to nature of residential area.  Would have catastrophic 
consequences on quality of life for those living in affected area.   



 
Planning Commission Meeting 9 June 2, 2004 Minutes 

Questions the rush to expedite the matter and the short notices sent to 
adjoining property owners.  Also feels that posting were insufficient in 
number and location.  There were only 2 postings for the entire 12 parcels. 
 Petition against proposal included with letter. 

21. Eileen Street, 2808 Ocean Beach Highway – Proposal to build car lot in 
that location was denied before and the developer moved it to another 
location.  Cited concerns for traffic, lighting and property value. 

22. Lu Alcid – concerns for traffic and property value.  Give Lowe’s property 
in the industrial park.  Lake too valuable an asset to compromise.  

23. Floyd VanFleet – problems he foresees:  proposed traffic light to enter & 
exit proposed store; traffic being added to an already congested area; 
dangerous crossing at 30th Avenue; property devaluation; lighting; 
competing retail stores.  Suggested solution – change zoning in Mint Farm 
from industrial to retail. 

24. Kandi McCulloch Williamson – opposed to increase in traffic.  18 car 
wrecks in 28 years, one with a fatality. 

25. Oliver Kaipe 2820 Maryland – too much traffic now without adding to it.   
26. Harold and Elsie Reust, 2791 Ocean Beach Highway – Not fair for 

taxpayers who have lived in area for 40 plus years.  Cannot get out of 
driveway now.  New light would make it impossible to get out. 
 Just bought house six months ago.  Would not have bought it had he 
known.  Find an industrial site! Home Depot did! 

27. John Brooks, 2795 Ocean Beach Highway – signed form letter with no 
comments. 

28. Otto and Dorothy Wheeler, 2802 Maryland – Do not destroy residential 
property with Lowe’s. 

29. Matthew & Jeanette Forman, 2825 Maryland – Supports good business 
and good jobs for Longview but do not approve of proposed location. 

30. Jessie Harris, 2834 Maryland, signed form letter with no comments. 
31. Bernice Groth, 2830 Maryland, signed form letter with no comments. 
32. Lola Parker – Don’t need any more home improvement stores, and sure 

don’t need any more traffic. 
33. Elaine Coats, 2821 Maryland – Concerned about traffic on Ocean Beach 

Highway and proposed traffic pattern changes at Nichols intersection. 
34. Ann Marie Fugate, 2918 Lilac Street – signed form letter with no 

comments. 
35. Another petition signed with 13 names in opposition of the proposal. 
36. F. and Elizabeth Algeciras, 2839 Maryland – signed form letter with no 

comments. 
37. George & Beverly Warren – Location chosen is inappropriate due to 

traffic congestion and effect on local residences’ mobility.  Should locate 
in industrial park. 

Staff found that there are several goals, objectives and policies contained within the 
Longview Comprehensive Plan that require amending via this petition. 

Staff further finds that the land use map must be amended or revised to accurately 
reflect the proposed development requested in this area.  The residential land uses on 



 
Planning Commission Meeting 10 June 2, 2004 Minutes 

the subject properties are proposed to be replaced with general commercial land uses. 
 This petition seeks to effectuate this change and to amend the official land use map. 

Staff further finds that the land use map needs to be revised for the subject properties 
prior to applying for permits to construct the project proposed for this site to bring it 
into conformance with the Plan Map of the Longview Comprehensive Plan.  The 
scale of the proposed project is classified as a regional commercial facility. 

Staff further finds that the proposal is in accordance with City Policy 1.07 inasmuch 
as it will eliminate 10 of the existing individual access points to a major arterial. 

Staff further finds that for the development project to be approved, City Policy 3.08 
shall be amended.  The petitioner seeks to amend this City Policy to permit 
commercial development on the subject properties. 

Staff further finds that the proposed development project promotes and implements 
Goals A, B, C, F & G of Section 2 (Economic Development) of the Longview 
Comprehensive Plan inasmuch as it promotes a diversified balanced economy, 
reduces the vulnerability of the to seasonal and cyclical economic downturns by 
reducing dependence on forest products industries, improves the existing industrial 
base and expands the non-manufacturing sector of the economy. 

Staff further finds that the proposed development project promotes the intent of City 
Policy 4.02 inasmuch as the project is locating adjacent to a developed commercial 
area. 

Staff further finds that the proposed development project is in substantial compliance 
with City Policy 4.03 inasmuch as there is an insufficient amount of available 
commercial development to accommodate larger retail development projects. 

Staff further finds that the addition of nearly 12 acres of general commercial land to 
the city’s vacant land inventory will not have a detrimental impact on the current mix 
of land uses, should the proposed development project fail to materialize. 

Staff finds that the petition to amend the Longview Comprehensive Plan to remove 
11.89± acres from the residential land use inventory and add it to the general 
commercial land use category is appropriate and consistent with some of the stated 
policies contained within the Plan, and will be in accordance with the revised policies 
proposed as amendments to the Plan. 

Staff further finds that the request to rezone the property to C-4 Commercial District 
is appropriate for the use envisioned, and is in keeping with the intent of the 
Longview Comprehensive Plan and therefore is appropriate for the subject property. 

Based on the analysis of the issues and findings of fact, staff recommends that the 
Planning Commission forward a recommendation of approval to the City Council for 
the comprehensive plan amendment, to change the land use designation on the 
Comprehensive Plan Map for the subject property from Low Density Residential land 
uses to General Commercial land uses. 



 
Planning Commission Meeting 11 June 2, 2004 Minutes 

Staff further recommends that the subject properties be rezoned from their current 
designation of S-R Suburban Residential District and R-1 Residential District, to C-4 
Commercial District, subject to approval of the text amendment petition that 
comprises Case No. PC 2004-4. 

At this point, Chairman Bankson called a five minute recess. 

Audience Participation 

Ken Spring pointed out that Weyerhaeuser has a railroad that runs through the area. 
He wondered if the Commission took this into consideration and how traffic 
congestion from slow-moving trains would be addressed.  Ninety-five percent of the 
people at this meeting are opposed to any changes,  yet the Planning Commission 
decided in a matter of minutes to make a decision that will adversely affect many of 
the people present.   He asserted that the Planning Commission members have 
already made up their mind and are showing favoritism to Lowe’s by laying the 
groundwork for them to build their store at that location. 

Mr. Fisher reminded the audience that Chairman Bankson had not yet opened it to the 
public for comments, and therefore, any statements would be out of order. 

Sid Klein wanted to make a point that this entire hearing was out of order.  He noted 
that a public hearing has to be published twice with a time span of no less than 10 
days prior to the meeting.  He stated that this hearing was advertised on May 21 and 
May 30, making it 9 days which would make this an illegal meeting.  He expressed 
that everything being done this evening should be null and void.  Further, he 
remarked that when there is a hearing the property must be posted at all four corners. 

Mr. Brickey explained that under State law, only one publication of the Notice of 
Public Hearing is required.  The City has chosen to exceed that requirement by 
amending our requirement to two publications, one 10 days prior to the hearing, and 
one 3 days prior to the hearing.  Further, he advised that there is no requirement to 
post the property, but it was posted in two locations.  Property owners within 300 feet 
were sent notices, which is also not a requirement.  

Mr. Bankson asked that the proponent step forward to make their presentation.   

Since this is a land use issue and not a project hearing, Mary Jane Melink questioned 
why the petitioner was being allowed to make a presentation.   

Mr. Brickey explained that the reason that Lowe's is making their presentation this 
evening is because they are the project proponent asking for the zone change. 

Mrs. Melink insisted that allowing Lowe's to make their presentation was premature, 
as this is specifically for a rezone and Comprehensive Plan amendment and not to 
discuss their project. 



 
Planning Commission Meeting 12 June 2, 2004 Minutes 

Mr. Spencer advised that the proponent has filed a petition requesting a relief from 
the Planning Commission and has a right to make their presentation.  It is not 
inappropriate for the proponent to include what they intend to do with the property.  It 
is up to the chairman to determine what can be allowed.  After the presentation, the 
Planning Commission will ask for input from anyone who has an interest in the 
matter.  

Read Stapleton, 5415 SW Westgate Drive #100, Portland, OR  97221, identified 
himself as the Senior Planner with WRG Design, the engineering, planning & 
landscape architectural firm representing Lowe's Companies, Inc.   

Mr. Stapleton first addressed the plan policy which encourages the infill of vacant 
residential land within the City of Longview.  He noted that there are a number of 
reasons that make redevelopment of this site for single family residential problematic 
such as nuisance issues and limited access.  Mr. Stapleton pointed out that eight 
single family residences on 12 acres in the center of the city does not bring in much 
in property taxes.  This is not efficient use of property within the city.  There are 
twelve unrestricted accesses to those existing residences, which is a potential safety 
hazard.  Finally, the property is not meeting its maximum use of public investment 
along Ocean Beach Highway in terms of utilities, roads, and public transit. 

Lowe's proposal is to redevelop the site as a commercial use, which is inherently 
more immune to nuisance factors generated by railroad, adjacent commercial, and 
high traffic volumes on Ocean Beach Highway.  The twelve existing access points 
will be consolidated down to essentially one access.  Additionally, a future Lowe's 
would employ approximately 175 - 200 employees, creating greater critical mass to 
use public transit investments along that corridor.  Significant property tax and sales 
tax revenue will be generated for the City of Longview.  Mr. Stapleton referenced a 
letter from Steve Gale of Lowe's which summarizes that approximately $2.5 Million 
will be generated by commercial development on the property over the next five 
years.  

Noting expressed concern that the economic benefit of the project will be negated by 
detrimental impacts to existing businesses, Mr. Stapleton did not believe this to be so. 
 He referenced a study within Mr. Gale's letter that addresses what happens when a 
large home improvement store enters a market where there is already the same kind 
of stores.  The study finds that within the first five to twelve months, there is a slack 
in the sales at other stores, but after 12 months, the market rebounds and there is more 
competition and more of a regional draw from people outside the city.  

The proposal will create approximately 175 to 200 jobs, 78% of which will be full 
time employees.  30% will be specialist positions, and 40% will be management 
positions.  He mentioned that there are 401K benefits available and ability to 
purchase stock options at a 10% discount.   

There was another concern about the traffic with the estimated 3,800 trips generated 
by the project over the course of the day.  Mr. Stapleton explained that less than 10% 



 
Planning Commission Meeting 13 June 2, 2004 Minutes 

of the trips will occur during the p.m. peak hour.  He felt that this was a conservative 
estimate. 

Mr. Stapleton disclosed their proposal for a traffic signal on the east side of the 
development near 28th Avenue, a right turn taper for west bound traffic on Ocean 
Beach Highway turning into that eastern access, a right turn deceleration lane for 
west bound traffic turning into the central shared access with Safeway, and a raised 
median on Ocean Beach Highway to the southwest and near 28th Avenue, which will 
be signalized. 

Another concern is impacted traffic to Lake Sacajawea.  He emphasized that a new 
Lowe's Store will have a sub-regional draw attracting customers from the northwest 
area of town. They surmise that the store will intercept traffic going past the lake.  
However, it can not be perceived that this project will draw in a substantial amount of 
new customers to create a detrimental impact to traffic near the lake. 

Finally, noise, visual impacts and aesthetics have also been a concern.  Mr. Stapleton 
expressed that these items are a concern any time that there is a commercial 
development adjacent to a single family residential area.  He referenced their SEPA 
application which is currently under review.  That SEPA provides the City an 
opportunity to attach mitigation measures, which will assure that this project will be 
compatible with the adjacent single family residents. 

Mr. Stapleton communicated specific measures being proposed, such as a 6.5 foot 
high concrete wall on north and east sides of the property for a noise buffer; a 17-35 
foot wide landscape buffer on the east side of the project; a 15-25 foot landscape 
buffer along the south side of the project for visual impacts to property across the 
street; significant interior landscaping; 

With regard to lighting, Mr. Stapleton indicated that they are considering providing 
cut-off fixtures on the parking lot lights to prevent off-site glare.  Roof top heating 
and cooling equipment will include energy-saving measures that allow the units to 
turn off at night, thereby eliminating any noise during that time. 

Mr. Morrill remarked that the 3,700 vehicles per day seemed like an aggressive 
number.  He asked whether the proposed concrete wall would be built on the north 
side as well as the east side.  Mr. Stapleton responded affirmatively. 

Mr. Barnett asked if there was a representative available who was involved with the 
siting at this location.  Mr. Stapleton replied that Steve Gale, who is the real estate 
manager for Lowe's was present and available to answer any questions. 

Steve Gale identified himself as the Director of Real Estate Acquisition with Lowe's 
HIW, Inc., 1530 Faraday Avenue, Suite 10, Carlsbad, CA   92008.  Mr. Gale reported 
that when they first came to Longview to look for a site, they focused their attention 
on the redevelopment of Triangle Mall.  When they negotiated an acquisition for a 
portion of that development, they discovered that Ace Hardware had a home 
improvement use exclusive, which precluded any other home improvement use from 



 
Planning Commission Meeting 14 June 2, 2004 Minutes 

locating in that development.  Mr. Gale informed the Commission that there are no 
commercial sites in Longview large enough to accommodate their store.  They will 
not go to an industrial area because they are not an industrial user. 

Mr. Smith remarked that he did not see a copy of the traffic study conducted by 
Kittelson and Associates and asked for a copy to review.  He asked how many hours 
Lowe's planned to be open during the day. 

Anthony Yee, Kittelson and Associates, 610 SW Alder, Portland, OR 97205 
identified himself as the traffic consultant on this project.  He informed Mr. Smith 
that Lowe's would be open 15 hours during the day.  In response to another question 
posed by Mr. Smith, Mr. Yee affirmed that Kittelson also did the traffic study for 
Safeway and Fred Meyer.  Mr. Smith proposed to delay any further discussion at this 
meeting until Commissioners can study all the issues. 

Mr. Morrill suggested that the Commission give people in the audience an 
opportunity to offer testimony they came to give. 

Another concern Mr. Barnett pointed out is that there is a SEPA application under 
review which addresses many issues that the Commission may be unaware of.  The 
comment period for that process ends June 9. 

Mr. Barnett directed a question on traffic to Mr. Yee.  Mr. Yee expressed that he 
could answer many questions the Commission might have by providing a brief 
summary on the traffic study.  He indicated that Kittelson provided information to the 
Transpo Group to incorporate into their study.  He then gave a brief technical 
overview of the traffic information provided within the study and answered additional 
questions regarding traffic and signalization.  Mr. Yee offered to provide the 
Commission with an actual traffic count to determine how many vehicles are actually 
entering the development area.  Mr. Smith voiced that he would be very interested in 
seeing that because he would like to compare it to the study Kittelson conducted for 
Safeway. 

Directing a question to staff, Mr. Barnett asked what the City was doing to address 
the traffic along that stretch of Ocean Beach Highway.   

Jeff Cameron, Public Works Director, revealed that the corridor study encompasses 
Olympia Way to 32nd Avenue, and they did include Lowe's site specific issues within 
that study.  He then gave a list of intersection signalizations that have been upgraded 
and synchronized. 

In the event that this public hearing was continued, Mr. Morrill was interested in how 
this would impact the proponent's time line as well as staff's.  This would give the 
Commission time to see the SEPA results and review the traffic study.  

Mr. Stapleton revealed that he discussed this matter with Principal Planner Robert 
Millspaw and the possibility of a special meeting on June 30 was mentioned if this 
hearing were continued.  Mr. Stapleton commented that a continuance would not 
have a significant impact on their project.   



 
Planning Commission Meeting 15 June 2, 2004 Minutes 

Mr. Brickey replied that staff would not be impacted by a continuance.  A project 
review commences when the Planning Commission forwards a recommendation and 
City Council acts upon that recommendation. 

Mr. Bankson asked whether there are other places in Longview where this type of 
action has taken place.  Mr. Brickey advised that a Comprehensive Plan Amendment 
and Rezone occurred with Wal-Mart, Fred Meyer, Safeway and other smaller 
projects.    
 
Audience Participation 

Prior to receiving public comments, Mr. Bankson reminded the audience that the 
same rules from the previous public hearing applied.   

Mary Jane Melink, 1410 23rd Avenue, Longview, declared that what the petitioner 
presented was project specific.  She asserted that this is a rezone hearing, not a 
project review hearing.  Mrs. Melink pointed out that there was no discussion or 
questions relating to consistency with the Comprehensive Plan. 

Mrs. Melink was given information that the staff report was not a public document 
and could not be made available to the public until a decision had been made on the 
issue by the Planning Commission.  Mr. Spencer clarified that it is not after a 
decision is made; it becomes available to the public once the Planning Commission 
receives their agenda packet as an entire body and not as an individual person, which 
usually occurs at a Planning Commission meeting. 

Noting that information had been given by Lowe’s representatives about what 
benefits would be offered to the employees, but Mrs. Melink wanted to know if 
medical insurance was available and whether it was a union facility. 

Mr. Gale of Lowe’s responded that medical insurance was available to all full time 
employees.  He also disclosed that Lowe’s was not a union organization. 

With regard to the SEPA application, Mrs. Melink implied that Lowe’s has already 
proceeded with the process under the assumption that an approval is impending.  It 
would seem that the zoning decision should be made first, and then start the SEPA 
review. 

In conclusion, Mrs. Melink asked that a continuance of this public hearing be granted 
to allow the public an opportunity to review the information. 

Terry Seals, 4457 Constitution, Longview, moved to Longview from the Portland 
area.  She exclaimed that she very proud to show us off to visiting friends and family. 
 She revealed, however, that Longview does not represent what she conceives to be a 
“planned city” as advertised.  Mrs. Seals commented that driving Ocean Beach 
Highway is more frightening than driving on Portland streets or the freeways. 

Mrs. Seals alleged that the small businesses will close when Lowe’s comes to town 



 
Planning Commission Meeting 16 June 2, 2004 Minutes 

because there is no way they can compete.  She commented that the work force is 
comprised primarily with entry level help that do not remain with the company.  
While she is not opposed to Lowe’s, Mrs. Seals is opposed to the location. 

Jim VanFleet, 2824 Maryland, Longview, related that there are four streets that will 
bear the increased traffic due to Lowe’s: Louisiana, Magnolia, Maple and Maryland.  
He referenced several developments west of Longview, noting that there is still land 
available to develop in that area.   When it is, there will be still more increased traffic 
on Ocean Beach Highway.  The City has determined that the corridor between 28th 
Avenue and 30th Avenue is too congested and dangerous.  Mr. VanFleet wanted to 
know why the City has changed their mind. 

Kerby Kee, 2839 Magnolia, Longview, wanted to know why the City Engineering 
Department did not bring up the proposed signalization modifications on Ocean 
Beach Highway at their informational meetings recently held. 

Mr. Cameron advised that the reason the Lowe’s issue was not brought up at their 
meeting when the eight options was discussed is because regardless of whether the 
property remains residential or is  commercially developed, the relative ranking of the 
eight options will not be affected. 

Kathryn Smith, 2744 Maryland, Longview read a prepared statement into the record. 
Mrs. Smith stated that it is not Lowe’s they object to, it is the location.  She feels that 
Lowe’s would be a good addition to our city. She did express concerns, however, for 
noise and traffic, not only on Ocean Beach Highway, but also around the lake.  She 
also cited industrialization of the area on Ocean Beach, including the lake. She 
questioned Lowe’s statement about certain lots on Ocean Beach Highway not being 
suitable for residential. 

Randy Hamlin,  29889 Riverview Drive, Rainier, Oregon, identified himself as a 
member of the Rainier City Council, Position No. 4.  Mr. Hamlin was present to 
make Lowe’s aware that there is a 16+ acre parcel available for development, located 
at the intersection of Highway 30 and the Lewis and Clark Bridge approach.  The 
property is zoned commercial and has already been granted a Special Property Use 
permit for use as a shopping center.  He invited Lowe’s to make an application to 
occupy that commercial space, reminding them that there is no sales tax in Oregon.  

Ann Hill, 2781 NW Nichols, Longview, commented that like many others, had 
nothing against Lowe’s and would welcome them into our community.  However, she 
objected to their choice of location, mainly because of traffic.  She urged Lowe’s to 
look for property west of town for another location to develop their store. 

Bill Cash, 2619 Nichols Boulevard, Longview, cautioned that after some time, small 
businesses will be driven out and big businesses will remain.  He communicated 
concern about increased traffic from the freeway on Nichols Boulevard and property 
values plummeting.  He commented that the Commission’s job is to defend the 
people, not side with outsiders. 


	10A.pdf
	Section 108.2.1.2 Inspection Fee – Wood Stoves
	Other Inspections and Fees


	10D.pdf
	Sec. 12.30.090(1).

	12A.pdf
	APPROVAL OF CLAIMS
	Payroll warrant numbers 187890 through 188014  Total  $158,4
	Payroll wire transfers      Total  $239,832.87
	Total Payroll Amt        $735,945.49


	12C.pdf
	19.51.010 Uses permitted.


